Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Adorama, Inc. B & H Foto and Electronics Corp
Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
1 Barcode Scanner - Zebra DS9300, Series DS9308- Zebra DS9308- Each No Bid No Bid
Standard Range (SR), USB Kit SR4U2100AZW
Camcorder - 10x HD Video Lens (30.4mm-304mm) 3.5
2 |inch Touchscreen LCD, HD CMOS Pro and 32GB Internal Canon VIXIA HF G20 Each Canon 3667C002 $1,025.31 Canon VIXIA HF G50 $1,099.00
Flash Memory
3 |Camcorder - 20.9 MP, 1080p, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony FDRAX53B Each Bid as Specified $998.00 FDRAX53B $988.20
Camcorder - Compact Full HD w/HDMI and Composite . .
4 Canon XAl11l Each Bid as Specified 1,199.00 CAXA11 1,014.00
Output, 2xSD/SDHC/SDXC Media Card Slots P > >
5 |camcorder, 8GB, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Son Handycam Each Sony HDRCX405/B HDRCX440 $298.00
, 8GB, Y #HDRCX440/B Y .
Cyber-Shot
6 |Camera - Digital , 20.1 Megapixel, 5x Optical Zoom Sony yDersno Each Bid as Specified $96.76 $98.00
DSCW800/B
7 |Camera - Digital 20.1 Megapixel, 8X Optical Zoom Sony Cyber-Shot DSCW830 | Each Bid as Specified $125.36 $128.00
8 [Camera - Digital with 16.0 Megapixel, 8x Optical Zoom Canon Elph 180 1093C001 Each Bid as Specified $139.69 $149.00
9 [Camera -Digital with 20 Megapixel and 8x Optical Zoom Canon PowerShot ELPH 180 Each No Bid CAPSE180S (1093C001) $149.00
C - Digital with 20 M ixel bined
10 |-amera- Uigttalwi egapixel sensor combine Canon PowerShot ELPH160 | Each No Bid $149.00
with the DIGIC 4+ Image Processor, 8x Optical Zoom
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Adorama, Inc.

B & H Foto and Electronics Corp

CVL Lavalier condenser microphone)

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
CD Player - Portable MP3 with iPod Docking, . . .
11 Supersonic SC-807 Each No Bid No Bid
USB/SD/AUX Inputs, Cassette Recorder, AM/FM Radio P
CD Player - Portable with AM/FM Stereo Radio and
12 v / Jensen CD-560 Each No Bid No Bid
Bluetooth
13 |DVD Player - Upscaling, Multiple Format Disc Playback Sony DVPSR510H Each No Bid DVPSR510H $39.88
Headset - USB Stereo with in-line volume and mute,
14 |adjustable headband control, ambidextrous boom arm, Cyber Acoustic AC851B Each No Bid No Bid
unidirectional noise-canceling microphone
Headset - USB with in-line Controls for Volume and Mic
15 |Mute, adjustable headband control, noise cancelling mic Cyber Acoustic AC5008 Each No Bid $19.00
and Adjustable Mic Boom
16 [Memory Card - 64 GB Elite performance UHS-1 SDX PNY P-SDX64U395-GE Each Bid as Specified $13.50 P-SDX64U395-GE $11.99
Microphone Stand - Chrome Round Base with Clutch
17 Contr:I Atlas Sound MS10C Each Bid as Specified $47.29 MS10C $43.99
Microphone Stand - Desktop, Adjustable Height 8-13
18 inch P B, Ad] & Atlas Sound DS-7 Each Bid as Specified $30.89 Bid as Specified $36.99
Microphone System - Lavalier Wireless System (includes
19 |BLX4 single channel receiver, BLX1 bodypack transmitter, Shure BLX14/CVL Each Bid as Specified $228.31 Bid as Specified $230.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District

IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Page 3 of 16

Adorama, Inc. B & H Foto and Electronics Corp
Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2

20 [Microphone: Cardioid Dynamic Vocal with 15' XLR cable Shure PGAS58-XLR Each Bid as Specified $40.50 PGAS58-XLR $37.00
21 |Microphone - Handheld Wireless System, H9 Band Shure BLX24/PG58 Each Bid as Specified $253.09 No Bid

Microphone - Headworn Wireless System - H10 Band SHBL 14P31H10
22 |(includes Cardioid Condenser Headworn Mic and Shure BLX14P31J10 Each Bid as Specified $253.09 BLX14P31H10 $230.00

Windscreen, Bodypack Transmitter, and Receiver
23 |Microphone - Line and Gradient Condenser Shotgun Audio-Technica AT875R Each Bid as Specified $133.86 AT875R $109.99

Mi h - Omnidirectional Cond C t
24 D;:L"p one - Umnidirectional Londenser tomputer Audio-Technica ATR4750 Each Bid as Specified $19.68 $17.00
25 |Microphone - Omnidirectional/Stereo Sony ECM-CS10 Each No Bid ECM-CS10 $34.99
26 [Mouse- Mini Wireless, Cordless with USB Receiver Logitech M1287 Each Logitech 910004940 - No Bid

PA System - Portable Wireless with Built-in
27 |Rechargeable Battery, FM Radio (Wireless Handheld Mic, PylePro PWMA1090UI Each Bid as Specified $182.06 No Bid

Headset Lavalier Mic, Remote Control) 800 Watt

Scanner - High Speed, Desktop Two Sided document . .
28 .|g P ] p wo st ! Brother Image Center ADS-2400N Each No Bid No Bid

color scanning- USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN
29 [Scanner - Trade Compliant Desktop Fujitsu FUFI7030TC Each No Bid $474.99
30 [Scanner - Sheet fed Color with Auto Document Feeder Fujitsu-Fi 7160 PA03670-B055 Each Fujitsu PA03750-B005 - PA03670-B085 $909.99




Tabulation Sheet Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Adorama, Inc.

B & H Foto and Electronics Corp

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
31 |Tripod - wheeled with Pro-4A 3-way Head DollyPod Dollypod IVA #700002 | Each Bid as Specified $193.08 Bid as Specified $214.95
Tripod - with 3-Way Pan/Tilt Head (Quick release Vista by Davis &
32 [P y Pan/ @ ) Y RANGERV Each No Bid No Bid
supports 7 pounds Sanford
Video Mixer - 4-channel with HDMI In/Out, USB
33 [Streaming Out, Onboard effects, and Built-in Multiviewer Roland V-4EX Each Bid as Specified $1,193.67 V4EX $1,178.00
with touch control

Additional Items

Additional Items

Additional Items

Per Special Terms and Conditions Section 6.9, provide guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for related items
purchased during the contract period for items not noted in this solicitation.

5% on items that are not restricted by manufacturer
pricing/items don't allow a discount

0.2-25% Plus shipping for items above 50Ib

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

Green Highlighted - Lowest vendor bid alternate brand, did not meet specifications

Vendor, Mvation non responsive
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Howard Industries, Inc. dba Howard Technology .
: Mvation
Vendor Solutions
Terms Net 30 Net 30

State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding

Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # UOM | or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
Barcode Scanner - Zebra DS9300, Series DS9308- DS9308-

1 ’ Zebra Each Bid as Specified 230.00 DS9308-SR4U2100AZW 239.12
Standard Range (SR), USB Kit SR4U2100AZW P > >
Camcorder - 10x HD Video Lens (30.4mm-304mm) 3.5

2 |inch Touchscreen LCD, HD CMOS Pro and 32GB Internal Canon VIXIA HF G20 Each No Bid 3667C002 B $1,447.47
Flash Memory

3 |Camcorder - 20.9 MP, 1080p, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony FDRAX53B Each No Bid FDRAX53B $1,057.16
Camcorder - Compact Full HD w/HDMI and Composite .

4 Canon XAl11l Each No Bid 2218C002 1,309.00
Output, 2xSD/SDHC/SDXC Media Card Slots ?

5 |camcorder, 8GB, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Son Handycam Each No Bid FDRAX100/B D $1,708.00

B y #HDRCX440/B Ehde
Cyber-Shot
6 |camera - Digital , 20.1 Megapixel, 5x Optical Zoom Sony yDersno Each No Bid DSCW800/B $105.93
DSCW800/B

7 |Camera - Digital 20.1 Megapixel, 8X Optical Zoom Sony Cyber-Shot DSCW830 | Each No Bid DSCW830 $138.03

8 [Camera - Digital with 16.0 Megapixel, 8x Optical Zoom Canon Elph 180 1093C001 Each Bid as Specified $149.00 1093C001 $169.98

9 [Camera -Digital with 20 Megapixel and 8x Optical Zoom Canon PowerShot ELPH 180 Each No Bid 1093C001 $169.69
C - Digital with 20 M ixel bined

10 |-amera- Uigttalwi egapixel sensor combine Canon PowerShot ELPH160 | Each No Bid ELPH 160 $225.25
with the DIGIC 4+ Image Processor, 8x Optical Zoom
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Howard Industries, Inc. dba Howard Technology

: Mvation
Vendor Solutions
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # UOM | or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2

CD Player - Portable MP3 with iPod Docking, . . "

11 S SC-807 Each Bid as S fied 75.00 SC-807 63.62
USB/SD/AUX Inputs, Cassette Recorder, AM/FM Radio upersonic ac d as specitie » »
CD Player - Portable with AM/FM Stereo Radio and

12 4 / Jensen CD-560 Each No Bid CD-560 $68.68
Bluetooth

13 |DVD Player - Upscaling, Multiple Format Disc Playback Sony DVPSR510H Each $51.00 DVPSR510H $47.08
Headset - USB Stereo with in-line volume and mute,

14 |adjustable headband control, ambidextrous boom arm, Cyber Acoustic AC851B Each $31.00 AC-851B $17.14
unidirectional noise-canceling microphone
Headset - USB with in-line Controls for Volume and Mic

15 |Mute, adjustable headband control, noise cancelling mic Cyber Acoustic AC5008 Each Bid as Specified $29.00 AC-5008 $18.74
and Adjustable Mic Boom

16 |Memory Card - 64 GB Elite performance UHS-1 SDX PNY P-SDX64U395-GE Each No Bid P-SDX64U395-GE s

31.31

Microphone Stand - Chrome Round Base with Clutch

17 P Atlas Sound MS10C Each No Bid MS-10C
Control $46.55
Microphone Stand - Desktop, Adjustable Height 8-13 .

18 | erop P, Adiu '8 Atlas Sound DS-7 Each No Bid DS7
inch $30.50
Microphone System - Lavalier Wireless System (includes

19 |BLX4 single channel receiver, BLX1 bodypack transmitter, Shure BLX14/CVL Each Bid as Specified $270.00 BLX14/P31-J11 $246.10
CVL Lavalier condenser microphone)
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Howard Industries, Inc. dba Howard Technology .
: Mvation
Vendor Solutions
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # UOM | or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
20 |Microphone: Cardioid Dynamic Vocal with 15' XLR cable Shure PGA58-XLR Each $48.00 PGA58-XLR $45.48
Bid as Specified
21 |Microphone - Handheld Wireless System, H9 Band Shure BLX24/PG58 Each . " $270.00 BLX24/PG58-H10 $246.10
Bid as Specified

Microphone - Headworn Wireless System - H10 Band
22 |(includes Cardioid Condenser Headworn Mic and Shure BLX14P31J10 Each Bid as Specified $270.00 BLX14/CVL-H10 $246.10

Windscreen, Bodypack Transmitter, and Receiver
23 |Microphone - Line and Gradient Condenser Shotgun Audio-Technica AT875R Each No Bid AT875R $123.05

Mi h - Omnidirectional Cond C t
24 D;:L"p one - Lmnidirectional Londenser -omputer Audio-Technica ATR4750 Each No Bid ATR4750-USB $19.80
25 |Microphone - Omnidirectional/Stereo Sony ECM-CS10 Each No Bid ECM-CS10 $37.45
26 |Mouse- Mini Wireless, Cordless with USB Receiver Logitech M1287 Each No Bid 988-000073 $69.00

PA System - Portable Wireless with Built-in
27 |Rechargeable Battery, FM Radio (Wireless Handheld Mic, PylePro PWMA1090UI Each No Bid PWMA1090UI $203.49

Headset Lavalier Mic, Remote Control) 800 Watt

Scanner - High Speed, Desktop Two Sided document . "
28 .|g P ] p wo st ! Brother Image Center ADS-2400N Each Bid as Specified $345.00 ADS-2400N $341.36

color scanning- USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN
29 [Scanner - Trade Compliant Desktop Fujitsu FUFI7030TC Each No Bid PA03670-B085 $947.29
30 [Scanner - Sheet fed Color with Auto Document Feeder Fujitsu-Fi 7160 PA03670-B055 Each Bid as Specified $1,047.00 PA03670-B085 $947.29
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Howard Industries, Inc. dba Howard Technology

: Mvation
Vendor Solutions
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # UOM | or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
31 |Tripod - wheeled with Pro-4A 3-way Head DollyPod Dollypod IVA #700002 | Each No Bid 700002 $240.60
Tripod - with 3-Way Pan/Tilt Head (Quick release Vista by Davis &
32 [P y Pan/ @ ) Y RANGERV Each No Bid 615-335 $55.50
supports 7 pounds Sanford
Video Mixer - 4-channel with HDMI In/Out, USB
33 [Streaming Out, Onboard effects, and Built-in Multiviewer Roland V-4EX Each No Bid V-4EX $1,313.96
with touch control

Additional Items

Additional Items

Additional Items

Per Special Terms and Conditions Section 6.9, provide guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for related items
purchased during the contract period for items not noted in this solicitation.

Discount off MSRP is 2-21% depending on the

product

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

Green Highlighted - Lowest vendor bid alternate brand, did not meet specifications

Vendor, Mvation non responsive
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Nisewonger Audio Visual Center, Inc. Romeo Music
Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uomM or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
1 Barcode Scanner - Zebra DS9300, Series DS9308- Zebra DS9308- Each No Bid No Bid
Standard Range (SR), USB Kit SR4U2100AZW
Camcorder - 10x HD Video Lens (30.4mm-304mm) 3.5
2 |inch Touchscreen LCD, HD CMOS Pro and 32GB Internal Canon VIXIA HF G20 Each No Bid No Bid
Flash Memory
3 |Camcorder - 20.9 MP, 1080p, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony FDRAX53B Each Bid as Specified $1,090.00 No Bid
C der - C t Full HD w/HDMI and C it
g |Cameorder - Compact Full HD w/ and omposite Canon XA11 Each No Bid No Bid
Output, 2xSD/SDHC/SDXC Media Card Slots
Handycam . .
5 |Camcorder, 8GB, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony Each No Bid No Bid
#HDRCX440/B
Cyber-Shot
6 |Camera - Digital , 20.1 Megapixel, 5x Optical Zoom Sony 4 Each No Bid No Bid
DSCW800/B
7 |Camera - Digital 20.1 Megapixel, 8X Optical Zoom Sony Cyber-Shot DSCW830 | Each No Bid No Bid
8 [Camera - Digital with 16.0 Megapixel, 8x Optical Zoom Canon Elph 180 1093C001 Each No Bid No Bid
9 [Camera -Digital with 20 Megapixel and 8x Optical Zoom Canon PowerShot ELPH 180 Each No Bid No Bid
Camera - Digital with 20 Megapixel sensor combined
10 [ & gap _ Canon PowerShot ELPH160 | Each No Bid No Bid
with the DIGIC 4+ Image Processor, 8x Optical Zoom
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Vendor
Terms

Nisewonger Audio Visual Center, Inc.

Net 30

Romeo Music

Net 30

State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
equivalent or item has been discontinued

State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
equivalent or item has been discontinued

CVL Lavalier condenser microphone)

Item
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uomM or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
CD Player - Portable MP3 with iPod Docking, . . .
11 Supersonic SC-807 Each No Bid No Bid
USB/SD/AUX Inputs, Cassette Recorder, AM/FM Radio P
CD Player - Portable with AM/FM Stereo Radio and
12 4 / Jensen CD-560 Each Bid as Specified $42.00 No Bid
Bluetooth
13 |DVD Player - Upscaling, Multiple Format Disc Playback Sony DVPSR510H Each No Bid No Bid
Headset - USB Stereo with in-line volume and mute,
14 |adjustable headband control, ambidextrous boom arm, Cyber Acoustic AC851B Each No Bid No Bid
unidirectional noise-canceling microphone
Headset - USB with in-line Controls for Volume and Mic
15 |Mute, adjustable headband control, noise cancelling mic Cyber Acoustic AC5008 Each No Bid No Bid
and Adjustable Mic Boom
16 |Memory Card - 64 GB Elite performance UHS-1 SDX PNY P-SDX64U395-GE Each No Bid No Bid
Microphone Stand - Chrome Round Base with Clutch
17 P Atlas Sound MS10C Each No Bid No Bid
Control
Microphone Stand - Desktop, Adjustable Height 8-13
18 |10 P P, Adu '8 Atlas Sound DS-7 Each No Bid No Bid
Microphone System - Lavalier Wireless System (includes
19 |BLX4 single channel receiver, BLX1 bodypack transmitter, Shure BLX14/CVL Each No Bid As specified $249.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Nisewonger Audio Visual Center, Inc.

Romeo Music

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uomM or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
20 |Microphone: Cardioid Dynamic Vocal with 15' XLR cable Shure PGA58-XLR Each No Bid $49.00
As specified
21 |Microphone - Handheld Wireless System, H9 Band Shure BLX24/PG58 Each No Bid . $249.00
As specified
Microphone - Headworn Wireless System - H10 Band
22 |(includes Cardioid Condenser Headworn Mic and Shure BLX14P31J10 Each No Bid $249.00
Windscreen, Bodypack Transmitter, and Receiver As specified
23 |Microphone - Line and Gradient Condenser Shotgun Audio-Technica AT875R Each No Bid No Bid
Microphone - Omnidirectional Condenser Computer
24 P P Audio-Technica ATR4750 Each Bid as Specified $8.50
Desk No Bid
25 |Microphone - Omnidirectional/Stereo Sony ECM-CS10 Each No Bid No Bid
26 |Mouse- Mini Wireless, Cordless with USB Receiver Logitech M1287 Each . .
No Bid No Bid
PA System - Portable Wireless with Built-in
27 |Rechargeable Battery, FM Radio (Wireless Handheld Mic, PylePro PWMA1090U| Each No Bid
Headset Lavalier Mic, Remote Control) 800 Watt No Bid
Scanner - High Speed, Desktop Two Sided document
28 . &N >p . p Brother Image Center ADS-2400N Each
color scanning- USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN
No Bid No Bid
29 [Scanner - Trade Compliant Desktop Fujitsu FUFI7030TC Each ) )
No Bid No Bid
30 |Scanner - Sheet fed Color with Auto Document Feeder Fujitsu-Fi 7160 PA03670-B055 Each ) )
No Bid No Bid
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

Vendor
Terms

Nisewonger Audio Visual Center, Inc.

Net 30

Romeo Music

Net 30

State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
equivalent or item has been discontinued

State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
equivalent or item has been discontinued

with touch control

Item
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uomM or model number has changed, specify Unit Price or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
31 |Tripod - wheeled with Pro-4A 3-way Head DollyPod Dollypod IVA #700002 | Each . .
No Bid No Bid
Tripod - with 3-Way Pan/Tilt Head (Quick release Vista by Davis &
32 [P y Pan/ @ ) Y RANGERV Each
supports 7 pounds Sanford
No Bid No Bid
Video Mixer - 4-channel with HDMI In/Out, USB
33 |Streaming Out, Onboard effects, and Built-in Multiviewer Roland V-4EX Each Bid as Specified $1,225.00 As specified $1,317.00

Additional Items

Additional Items

Additional Items

Per Special Terms and Conditions Section 6.9, provide guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for related items
purchased during the contract period for items not noted in this solicitation.

4% off MSRP

10

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

Green Highlighted - Lowest vendor bid alternate brand, did not meet specifications

Vendor, Mvation non responsive
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District

IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

School Outfitters LLC

Troxell Communications, Inc.

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify [ Unit Price| or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
1 Barcode Scanner - Zebra DS9300, Series DS9308- Zebra DS9308- Each No Bid NO BID
Standard Range (SR), USB Kit SR4U2100AZW
Camcorder - 10x HD Video L 30.4mm-304 3.5
2 |inch “:I'ouchscreexn LCDIHeI;)CIfAnCS)S( Pro zr::\rg SZGanIr:zernal Canon VIXIA HF G20 Each No Bid HF G20 DISCONTINUED, BIDDING HF $1,046.90
’ G50 AS ALTERNATE ITEM#3667C002 T
Flash Memory
3 |Camcorder - 20.9 MP, 1080p, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony FDRAX53B Each No Bid FDRAX53B $1,002.27
Camcorder - Compact Full HD w/HDMI and Composite .
4 Canon XA11l Each No Bid XA11 1,310.34
Output, 2xSD/SDHC/SDXC Media Card Slots »
Handycam . .
5 |Camcorder, 8GB, Exmor R CMOS Sensor Sony Each No Bid DISCONTINUED - No Bid
#HDRCX440/B
- . . Cyber-Shot .
6 |Camera - Digital , 20.1 Megapixel, 5x Optical Zoom Sony Each No Bid Cyber-Shot DSCWS800/B $110.23
DSCW800/B
7 |Camera - Digital 20.1 Megapixel, 8X Optical Zoom Sony Cyber-Shot DSCW830 | Each No Bid Cyber-Shot DSCW830 $145.45
8 |Camera - Digital with 16.0 Megapixel, 8x Optical Zoom Canon Elph 180 1093C001 Each No Bid Elph 180 1093C001 w/ 20 megapixel $134.99
9 |Camera -Digital with 20 Megapixel and 8x Optical Zoom Canon PowerShot ELPH 180 Each No Bid NO BID
o Bi
C - Digital with 20 M ixel bined
10 amera - Jigltal wi CEAPIXE] sensor comoine Canon PowerShot ELPH160 Each No Bid discontinued model - No Bid

with the DIGIC 4+ Image Processor, 8x Optical Zoom
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

School Outfitters LLC

Troxell Communications, Inc.

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify [ Unit Price| or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
CD Player - Portable MP3 with iPod Docking, . .
11 Supersonic SC-807 Each No Bid SC-807 79.64
USB/SD/AUX Inputs, Cassette Recorder, AM/FM Radio P s
CD PI - Portable with AM/FM St Radi d
12 ayer - Portable with AM/FM Stereo Radio an Jensen CD-560 Each No Bid NO BID
Bluetooth
13 [DVD Player - Upscaling, Multiple Format Disc Playback Sony DVPSR510H Each No Bid DVPSR510H $49.35
Headset - USB Stereo with in-line volume and mute,
14 |adjustable headband control, ambidextrous boom arm, Cyber Acoustic AC851B Each Egghead EGG-IAG-1007FAUSB-SO $21.74 AC851B $31.14
unidirectional noise-canceling microphone
Headset - USB with in-line Controls for Volume and Mic
15 |Mute, adjustable headband control, noise cancelling mic Cyber Acoustic AC5008 Each Egghead EGG-IAG-3002TRSS-SO $19.98 AC5008 $31.61
and Adjustable Mic Boom
16 [Memory Card - 64 GB Elite performance UHS-1 SDX PNY P-SDX64U395-GE Each No Bid NO BID
Microphone Stand - Chrome Round Base with Clutch
17 P Atlas Sound MS10C Each No Bid MS10C $62.52
Control
Microphone Stand - Desktop, Adjustable Height 8-13 .
18 |10 P P Ad § Atlas Sound DS-7 Each No Bid DS-7 $48.82
Microphone System - Lavalier Wireless System (includes
19 [BLX4 single channel receiver, BLX1 bodypack transmitter, Shure BLX14/CVL Each No Bid BLX14/CVL $245.69
CVL Lavalier condenser microphone)
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

School Outfitters LLC

Troxell Communications, Inc.

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify [ Unit Price| or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2

20 |Microphone: Cardioid Dynamic Vocal with 15' XLR cable Shure PGA58-XLR Each No Bid PGA58-XLR $39.31
21 |Microphone - Handheld Wireless System, H9 Band Shure BLX24/PG58 Each No Bid BLX24/PG58 $245.69

Microphone - Headworn Wireless System - H10 Band
22 ((includes Cardioid Condenser Headworn Mic and Shure BLX14P31J10 Each No Bid BLX14P31J10 $245.69

Windscreen, Bodypack Transmitter, and Receiver
23 |Microphone - Line and Gradient Condenser Shotgun Audio-Technica AT875R Each No Bid AT875R $134.60

Microphone - Omnidirectional Condenser Computer
24 | P P Audio-Technica ATR4750 Each No Bid ATR4750USB $32.62
25 |Microphone - Omnidirectional/Stereo Sony ECM-CS10 Each No Bid ECM-CS10 $44.89
26 |M Mini Wirel Cordl ith USB Recei Logitech M1287 Each No Bid WIRLESS MINI $28.66

- Mini Wir r wi iver i i .
ouse eless, Cordless eceive ogitec ac MOUSE M187

PA System - Portable Wireless with Built-in
27 |Rechargeable Battery, FM Radio (Wireless Handheld Mic, PylePro PWMA1090UI Each No Bid PWMA1090UI $275.63

Headset Lavalier Mic, Remote Control) 800 Watt

Scanner - High Speed, Desktop Two Sided document .
28 .|g P ] p wo sl ! Brother Image Center ADS-2400N Each No Bid NO BID

color scanning- USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN
29 [Scanner - Trade Compliant Desktop Fujitsu FUFI7030TC Each No Bid NO BID
30 [Scanner - Sheet fed Color with Auto Document Feeder Fujitsu-Fi 7160 PA03670-B055 Each No Bid NO BID
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Tabulation Sheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2121, Audiovisual Equipment and Supplies

School Outfitters LLC

Troxell Communications, Inc.

Vendor
Terms Net 30 Net 30
State "Bid as Specified". If bidding State "Bid as Specified". If bidding
Item equivalent or item has been discontinued equivalent or item has been discontinued
Description Manufacturer Model/Part # uom or model number has changed, specify [ Unit Price| or model number has changed, specify Unit Price
# manufacturer model/part number per manufacturer model/part number per
Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2 Special Terms and Conditions, Section 2.2
31 |Tripod - wheeled with Pro-4A 3-way Head DollyPod Dollypod IVA #700002 | Each No Bid NO BID
Tripod - with 3-Way Pan/Tilt Head (Quick release Vista by Davis &
32 P y Pan/ @ ) v RANGERV Each No Bid NO BID
supports 7 pounds Sanford
Video Mixer - 4-channel with HDMI In/Out, USB
33 [Streaming Out, Onboard effects, and Built-in Multiviewer Roland V-4EX Each No Bid VAEX $1,323.28

with touch control

Additional Items

Additional Items

Additional Items

Per Special Terms and Conditions Section 6.9, provide guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for related items
purchased during the contract period for items not noted in this solicitation.

Discounts vary 1-70% off List Price, by manufacturer and product.
Quantity discounts may be available. See our online catalog,
displaying List Price, as updated by our manufacturers, at

https://customer.trox.com/products.htm/.

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

Green Highlighted - Lowest vendor bid alternate brand, did not meet specifications

Vendor, Mvation non responsive
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