Tabsheet

Cobb County School District
IFB B2230, Ceiling Tile and Flooring Supplies

Vendor Continental Flooring Company Environmental Tech Products Fastenal Company
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Item | CCSD# Description ;i\t, ‘ Unit ‘ Manufacturer/Part # Manufacturer/Part # | Unit Price Ext. Price Manufacturer/Part # ‘ Unit Price Ext. Price Manufacturer/Part # Unit Price Ext. Price
GROUP 1 - CEILING GRID AND TILES
Hanger wire; Specify Qty Per Bundle Armstrong Ceilings USG-140 pieces per
1 NA 140 pieces 12" long 10 |Bundle #7891 $143.79 $1,437.90 [bundle $105.00 $1,050.00{12HW-12 $98.55 $985.50
Donn M7. Must
Donn M7 480 L/F White purchase in full
2 BH-181 |Ceiling Grid Edge Molding, 12’ x 7/8” 60 Ea |Only cartons. 40/EA/CTN $11.30 $678.00|Donn m7 480 L/f $9.00 $540.00| DM7-050 $7.86 $471.60
Donn DXLA24. Must
purchase in full
3 BH-180 |Ceiling Grid Main Runner 60 Ea_|[Donn DXLA24 White Only |cartons. 20 EA/CTN $29.55 $1,773.00| Donn DSLA24 WH $13.50 $810.00| DXLA24-050 $15.63 $937.80
Donn DXLA216. Must
purchase in full
4 | BH-183 |Ceiling Grid Cross Tees 2’ 120| Ea |Donn SDX216 White, Only |cartons. 60 EA/CTN $5.05 $606.00| Donn DXLA216 $2.40 $288.00| DXLA216-050 $2.61 $313.20
purchase in full
5 | BH-182 |Ceiling Grid Cross Tees 4 60 | Ea |Donn DX422 White, Only |cartons. 60 EA/CTN $9.85 $591.00| Donn DXLA424 $4.50 $270.00| DXLA424-050 $5.21 $312.60
Certain Teed BET 197 (or
6 BH-080 |Ceiling Tile 2’ x 4’ x 5/8”; Baroque 500 | Case |approved equivalent Armstrong #769 $80.89 $40,445.00 | Certain TEED BET 157 $54.54 $27,270.00(CBET197 $44.93 $22,465.00
Armstrong #769 (or
7 BH-083 |Ceiling Tile 2’ x 4’ x 5/8”; Cortega 200 | Case |approved equivalent) Armstrong #769 $80.89 $16,178.00 [Armstrong 769 $97.92 $19,584.00 [A769 $104.98 $20,996.00
USG #2310 (or approved
8 | BH-080A |Ceiling Tile 2’ x 4’ x 5/8”; Radar 350 | Case |equivalent) USG #2310 $85.87 $30,054.50 |USG Radar #2310 $55.20 $19,320.00 |USG2310 $39.50 $13,825.00
Ceiling Panel 2’ x4’ x %", Vinyl National Gypsum (or National Gypsum Part
9 NA Covered Gypsum; 50 | Case |approved equivalent) USG #3270 $69.45 $3,472.50 |#5044/# CTGN24 $44.65 $2,232.50 [USG3270 $27.20 $1,360.00
Armstrong A7875;
Hold Down Clip, A7875; Specify Qty Armstrong #A7875 or 100 per box new NO BID
10 NA Per Bundle 5 Bx_|Equal Armstrong CHDC $29.63 $148.15 |Arm 7875 $50.00 $250.00 [#36410521 $0.00
Hold Down Clip, 20428; Specify Qty USG #20428 100 per box |USG, 100 per box USG, 100 per box
11 NA Per Bundle 5 Bx__|(or approved equivalent) 20428 $500.00 $2,500.00 |USG 20428 $1,980.00 $9,900.00 |20428 $1,768.50 $8,842.50
Erico Caddy #2H4, 100 per
Beam Clamp, 2H4; Specify Qty Per box (or approved NO BID
12 NA  |Bundle 5 Bx__|equivalent) #2H4 $173.34 $866.70 |Erico 24H $125.00 $625.00 $0.00
Group 1 —Sub Total $98,750.75 $82,139.50 $70,509.20
GROUP 2 - Floor Tile and Carpet Repair Suppli
Carpet, Seam and Mutli-purpose NO BID
1 FC-001 |Adhesive 48 | at. |Anchor 15 Only Powerhold 020 $37.71| $1,810.08 |Anchor 15 $18.90 $907.20 [Anchor $0.00
Stripper Blades .017, 4 Inch 10 per
2 FC-002 |[Tube 50 | Tube |Personna #61-0027 Only  [Personna 61-0027 $27.42| $1,371.00 |Personna 61-0027 $12.00 $600.00 |Personna NO BID $0.00
Heavy Duty Carpet Blades .017, Square NO BID
3 FC-003 |Corner Blade 1000 per Box 10 Bx _|Personna #60-0023 Only |Personna 61-0223 $40.91 $409.10 Personna 61-0023 $23.40 $234.00 [Personna $0.00
Self Drying, Cement Based Finishing
4 FC-004 |Underlayment 10 LB. Bag 60 | Bags |Ardex Feather Finish Only [Ardex SD-F $44.80 $2,688.00  |Ardex $27.25 $1,635.00 [Ardex $22.96 $1,377.60
Roberts7200 (or approved |Powerhold 5500 30- NO BID
5 FC-005 |Cove Base Adhesive, 30 oz. Tube 60 | Tube |equivalent) o0z $29.42 $1,765.20  |Roberts $8.98 $538.80 |Roberts $0.00
6 FC-006 [Outdoor Carpet Adhesive 4 Gal. Can 12 | Cans |Henry 663 Only Henry 330 $105.28 $1,263.36 Henry 663 $97.25 $1,167.00 |Henry NO BID $0.00
Ultra-Premium Vinyl Compostion Tile Chapco Safe-Set 7 Product NO BID
7 FC-007 |Adhesive 4 Gal. Can 12 | Cans |#70-4749-1369 Chapco SS-7 $78.79 $945.48 Chapco Safe set 7 $68.41 $820.92 |Chapco $0.00
NO BID
8 FC-008 |[Applicator Bottle for Seam Sealer 8 oz. | 24 Ea |Gundlach # 145 Only LFS 745 $25.75 $618.00 Gundlach #145 $2.70 $64.80 |Gundlach $0.00
Group 2 Sub Total $10,870.22 $5,967.72 $1,377.60
Total of Groups $109,620.97 $88,107.22 $71,886.80
Other Related Items Fee Structure Fee Structure Fee Structure
Per Section 6.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include
1 an item(s), responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related
items that may be purchased during the award period. Vendors are to identify the pricing
source and the associated fee structure in the space to the right.
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