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Clock and Clock Movements, Q2020011
Vendor American Time Georgia Time Recorder South Y\Ies.tern
Co., Inc. Communication Inc.
Terms Net 30
Net 30 Net 30
Est.
Item #| CCSD # Description Mfg. Mfg. Part # Qty Unit Price| Total Cost [Unit Price| Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
Clock 12" Slim Line , Battery. . .
1 FS060 Black y American Time ES56BADD304 50 $27.04 $1,352.00 $34.89 $1,744.50 $25.76 $1,288.00
Clock 12" Slim Line , With
2 NEW [Battery Booster, Black American Time ES6BADD304BP [ 50 $32.05 $1,602.50 $37.78 $1,889.00 $30.54 $1,527.00
NO AWARD
All Double Clock, 120 Volt, . .
3 | Fsoe2 [0 oYnePoubletioc © American Time US3BAAA204 | 60 | $311.59 | $18,695.40 | $290 | $17,400.00 | $286.42 | $17,185.00
Surface Mount, Black
All Surface Mount Clock, . .
4 | Fs115 lzéy\r/‘;t uglzii ountHoc American Time US4BAAA304 | 100 | $127.36 | $12,736.00 | $129.00 | $12,900.00 | $116.50 | $11,650.00
GPS Clock 12 1/2", 120 Volt, i ) . . .
5 | Fsus | oc / © Primex 14155E 60 | No Bid NoBid | $149.00 | $8,940.00 No Bid No Bid
GPS Clock 12 1/2" Battery, i ) . . .
6 | Fsi19 | oc /2" Battery Primex 14155 30 | No Bid NoBid | $125.00 | $3,750.00 No Bid No Bid
7 FS117 |Simplex Clock Movement American Time N1276 100 | $110.31 | S$11,031.00 $99.87 $9,987.00 $90.12 $9,012.00
Clock Movement with Hands
8 FS093 |CLKMOV 120 Rauland SRX-HH-12-HD 50 |*S213.53| *S$10676.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NO AWARD
9 Per Section 5.8 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include
an item(s), responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related
items that may be purchased during the award period. Example responses are: X%
discount below MSRP; X% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-
up.
Deli ithin 10
i i i ) SHVery within 10 days after receiving
Required Lead Time Upon Receipt of Order business days of Purchase
Order Purchase Order

Awarded Vendor Highlighted in Yellow
*Did Not Meet Specifications
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