

		Vendor: Terms: Lead Time:		Atlanta Kubota LLC. 0.1% within 2 days; Net 10 Days 30-45 Days or less ARO				Felshaw Capital Ventures, Inc. dba Taylor Outdoor Power Equipment & Supplies Net 30 Days 1-2 Weeks ARO			Master Mower Sales & Service LLC Net 30 Days 2-3 Weeks			Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. Net 30 Days 30 Days ARO			Towne Lake Outdoor Power Equipment Net 30 Days 10 Days ARO		
Item #	Description	Brand/Model #	UOM	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Unit Price with Discount	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price
1	New, current year 48" Zero Turn Commercial Diesel Mower with side discharge and foldable ROPS. Features to include: Diesel Engine D782-E4-ZD-3, 19.3 HP, Deck - RCK48P-1000Z, PRO Deck with Aerodynamic Cutting System (ACS), Hydraulic lift, Shaft driven, Battery - Maintenance Free, 12V, CCA: 430A, RC: 80 min. Alternator - 14A @ 14V, Seat - Deluxe suspension. Run flat front tires.	Kubota ZD1000 Series ZD1011-48	EA	Kubota ZD1000 Series ZD1011-3-48	24 Months	\$10,119.00	\$10,108.88			No Bid			No Bid	Grasshopper Model 325D/52. 25hp, 52" side discharge zero-turn, commercial mower.	3 Yr. Limited Commercial Warranty. 2 Yrs.-Parts & Labor coverage with no Hour limit. 3rd Yr.-Parts only.	\$12,477.00			No Bid
2	New, current year 72" Zero Turn Commercial Diesel Mower with side discharge and foldable ROPS. Features to include: Diesel Engine D1105-E4-ZD-2, 25 HP, Deck - RCK72P-1200Z, PRO Deck with ACS, Hydraulic lift, Shaft driven, Battery - Maintenance Free, 12V, CCA: 430A, RC: 80 min. Alternator - 14A @ 14V, Seat - Deluxe suspension w/reclining and lumbar support. Run flat front tires.	Kubota ZD1200 Series ZD1211L-72	EA	Bid Spec	24 Months	\$13,299.00	\$13,285.70	Scag Turf Tiger II TTII-72V-25KBD	2 Yr./No Hr. 3 Yr./500 Hr. 3 Yr./GNG & Deck	\$15,699.00			No Bid	Grasshopper Model 325D/72. 25hp, 72" side-discharge, zero turn, commercial mower.	3 Yr. Limited Commercial Warranty. 2 Yrs.-Parts & Labor coverage with no Hour limit. 3rd Yr.-Parts only.	*\$12,777.00			No Bid
3	New, current year 72" Zero Turn Commercial Diesel Mower with side discharge and foldable ROPS. Features to include: Diesel Engine V1505-T-E4-ZD, 30 HP, Deck - RCK72P-1500Z, PRO Deck with ACS, Hydraulic lift, Shaft driven, Battery - Maintenance Free, 12V, CCA: 67A, RC: 115 min. Alternator - 60A @ 12V, Seat- Air Ride suspension with reclining and lumbar support. Run flat front tires.	Kubota ZD1500 Series ZD1511LF-72	EA	Bid Spec	24 Months	\$17,205.00	\$17,187.80			No Bid			No Bid	Grasshopper Model 400D/72. 25hp (1,261cc), 72" side-discharge, zero-turn, commercial mower.	3 Yr. Limited Commercial Warranty. 2 Yrs.-Parts & Labor coverage with no Hour limit. 3rd Yr.-Parts only.	*\$14,478.00			No Bid
4	New, current year 72" Zero Turn Commercial Gas Mower with side discharge and foldable ROPS. Features to include: Vanguard EFI Engine, 37 HP, Cutting deck of 7-ga steel, Hydraulic lift, Shaft driven.	Scag Turf Tiger II Model #STTII-72V-37BV-EFI	EA			No Bid	No Bid	BaS-Note unit does not have hydraulic lift.	2 Yr./No Hr. 3 Yr./500 Hr. 3 Yr./GNG & Deck	**\$11,999.00			No Bid	Grasshopper Model 337G5/72. 72" side-discharge, zero-turn commercial mower.	3 Yr. or 1,250/hrs. 2 Yr. Parts.	*\$9,798.00	Mower does not have hydraulic lift. Deck lift is spring tensioned.	2 Years	\$11,999.00

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yello
*Does not meet CCSD Specifications
**Tie Bid awarded per GT, Section 12.3

Vendor: Terms: Lead Time:		Atlanta Kubota LLC. 0.1% within 2 days; Net 10 Days 30-45 Days or less ARO					Felshaw Capital Ventures, Inc. dba Taylor Outdoor Power Equipment & Supplies Net 30 Days 1-2 Weeks ARO				Master Mower Sales & Service LLC Net 30 Days 2-3 Weeks			Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. Net 30 Days 30 Days ARO			Towne Lake Outdoor Power Equipment Net 30 Days 10 Days ARO				
Item #	Description	Brand/Model #	UOM	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Unit Price with Discount	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price	Bid as Specified or Indicate Alternate Brand/Model Number per ST&C 2.1 and 2.4	Mfr. Warranty	Unit Price		
5	New, current year 48" Stand On Commercial Mower. Features to include: 48" Cutting deck of 7-ga steel, 23.5 HP Vanguard EFI Engine, 8 gal fuel capacity, 9.5 mph ground speed. 4 ply Pneumatic drive tires and flat free castor tires.	Wright Series Stander X	EA	Kubota SZ-22-48	24 Months	\$6,925.00	*\$6,918.08	V-RIDE II Scag SVRII-48V-22FX, 22 HP, Non EFI All else ok. (See specifications included.)	2 Yr./No Hr. 3 Yr./500 Hr. 3 Yr./GNG & Deck	*\$7,099.00	As Specified	2 Years, Unlimited Hours	\$7,600.00			No Bid			No Bid		
6	New, current year 72" Stand-On Commercial Mower. Features to include: 72" cutting deck of 7-ga steel, 37 HP Vanguard EFI engine, 15.5-gal fuel capacity, 12.5 mph ground speed. Two (2) drive tires sized 24x12-12 with optional dual wheel kit for extra traction and trimmer holder.	Wright Series Stander ZK	EA			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	As Specified	2 Years, Unlimited Hours	\$10,000.00			No Bid			No Bid		
		Dual Wheel Kit	EA			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	As Specified		\$1,100.00			No Bid			No Bid		
		Trimmer Holder	EA			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	As Specified		\$100.00			No Bid			No Bid		
ADDITIONAL RELATED ITEMS				FEE STRUCTURE <i>(i.e. X% discount below MSRP; x% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up per ST&C, Section 9.8)</i>				FEE STRUCTURE <i>(i.e. X% discount below MSRP; x% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up per ST&C, Section 9.8)</i>				FEE STRUCTURE <i>(i.e. X% discount below MSRP; x% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up per ST&C, Section 9.8)</i>				FEE STRUCTURE <i>(i.e. X% discount below MSRP; x% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up per ST&C, Section 9.8)</i>					
1	Parts/Accessories for mowers.	20% Below MSRP & Free Freight				15% MSRP				No				10% off Grasshopper Whole Goods MSRP Effective Upon Award							
2	Are there any additional discounts on quantity purchases of mowers?	No				No				No				No							
3	Are there any additional discounts on similar brands of mowers with different features?	No				Yes. Depending on make/model, percentage discount based off "Bid Assist" pricing.				Yes. Depending on make/model, percentage discount offered per current Brand "BaseBoard" price list . Pricing structure can be provided, if requested.				No							
OTHER RELATED ITEMS																					
1	Per Section 4.1 of the Special Terms & Conditions, provide details on Safety/Maintenance Training.	Atlanta Kubota will provide safety and operational training on each model at a time and place of CCSD choosing.				DVD provided. Upon delivery, Taylor will have a rep review operation and safety features as well as maintenance cycle of units.				Yes, this would entail proper operation and safety of the mowers. Master Mower can do a service education for technicians tailored to meet what training needs CCSD felt was needed for the equipment.				Safety/Maintenance training will be provided upon delivery of ordered equipment.				Yes. Towne Lake will meet with operators and go through machine discussing use and maintenance of mower.			

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow
*Does not meet CCSD Specifications
**Tie Bid awarded per GT, Section 12.3