
Tabsheet Cobb County School District
IFB B1906, Custodial Equipment

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Not Approved Brand/Model #
**Vendor Withdrew Price Offered Page 1 of 2

Item 
# Description Approved Brand/Model # UOM

New Brand/Model 
Part # per Special 

Terms and 
Conditions 2.1 Warranty  Unit Price 

New Brand/Model 
Part # per Special 

Terms and 
Conditions 2.1 Warranty  Unit Price 

New Brand/Model 
Part # per Special 

Terms and 
Conditions 2.1 Warranty  Unit Price 

New Brand/Model 
Part # per Special 

Terms and 
Conditions 2.1 Warranty  Unit Price 

1 Vacuum, Small Tennant V-HDU-14/9007462 EA ADV-107404754 3 Years Parts
1 Year labor

*$288.75 As Specified 1YR/1YR $752.60 Standard 
Manufacturer

$1,248.00

2 Vacuum, Medium Tennant V-WA-26/9007457 EA ADV-CUDA26
3 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
* $892.50 As Specified 3YR/3YR $1,534

Standard 
Manufacturer

$2,836.00

3
Vacuum Back Pack (with 
tool kit)

Tennant V-BP-6/1060830 EA ADV-9060608010
3 Years Parts
1 Year labor

*$296.25 As Specified 1YR/1YR $511.95
Standard 

Manufacturer
$1,739.00

4 Extractor with Tools
Tennant 1530/614000 
(includes 600048, 160400, 
160185)

EA ADV-56317005
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$8,089.00 As Specified 3YR/3YR $8,605.95

5 Extractor, Spot Tennant 9007502/EX-SPOT-2 EA ADV-WOLF130
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$333.75 As Specified 1YR/1YR $648.90

Standard 
Manufacturer

$1,272.00

6 Carpet Dyer Tennant 614277 EA ADV-50000390 1 Year Parts
1 Year Labor

*$133.75 As Specified 3YR/3YR $286.50

1 Burnisher, Riding, 27” NSS E-Force EA As Specified
3YR/1YR 
LABOR

$11,975.00 Tennant B10-690 3YR/2YR $15,495.95

3 Years 
Limited, 10 
Years Poly 

Parts

$18,514.00

2
Burnisher, Walk-Behind, 
Battery Operated

Tennant B5 HEPA filtration 20 
in., 510 MM Propel, B5-
510/SELF B5

EA ADV-56383511
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$7,136.25 As Specified 3YR/2YR $8,250.85

3 Burnisher, Electric
Tennant 2370/9007349 BR-
2000-DC

EA ADV-01520A
3 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$1,547.50 As Specified 3YR/3YR $1,956.00

Discontinued-
3yrs parts, 3yrs 
labor. No travel 

$3,245.00

4 Scrubber, Orbital
Tennant T300E with ecH20, 20 
in. MV-T300E-0010

EA ADV-56383556
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$6,240.00 As Specified 3YR/2YR $8,680.25

5
Scrubber, Micro-rider 
Floor

Tennant T7 ecH20/90066143 EA ADV-56381803
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$11,016.25 As Specified 3YR/3YR $16,596.35

Standard 
Manufacturer

$16,140.00

6 Scrubber, Stand-on Advance SC1500REV EA ADV-56104013
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
$6,443.17 As Specified

3YR/2YR 
LABOR

$7,722.50
Tennant T350/ MV-

T350-0002
3YR/2YR $9,533.90

Standard 
Manufacturer

$11,791.00

7
Surface Preparation 
Machine with Malish Grip 
Base

Square Scrub EBG-20C EA As Specified 2YR/2YR $2,464.50
Standard 

Manufacturer
$4,216.00

8 Floor Preparation 
Scrubber

Square Scrub Doodle Scrub  
EBG-9

EA As Specified 1YR/1YR $694.75 Standard 
Manufacturer

$996.00

DISCONTINUED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Zenn Group LLC
Net 30 Days
15-30 Days

GROUP 1 - CARPET CARE  

SouthEast Link
Net 30 Days

2-10 Days

GROUP 2 - HARD FLOOR CARE  

Vendor Name:
Terms:

Lead Time Upon Receipt of Purchase Order:

NO BID

America's 1st Maintenance
Net 30 Days

3-4 Business Days

Atlanta MRO Supply
Net 30 Days

7-10 Business Days

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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9
Surface Preparation 
Machine with Mailsh Grip 
Base

Square Scrub EBG-
28/SS142003M

EA As Specified 2YR/2YR $3,496.15
3 YR Limited 

Warranty
$5,979.00

10 Wand, Deluxe Carpet KaiVac CVA06 EA As Specified N/A $336.50

11
Cleaning System, No-
Touch

KaiVac KV1750 EA ADV-56381594
3 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$2,601.25 Kaivac KV17501 3YR/1YR $3,075.00

Standard 
Manufacturer

$4,500.00

12 Floor Finishing System 
Complete

Hilliard Multiflow XP HIL50110 EA As Specified 1 YR $985.00 Standard 
Manufacturer

$1,336.00

13
Floor Finishing, Gym, 
Water Based Conversion 
Kit

Hilliard Multiflow XP HIL50261 EA As Specified 1 YR $490.00
Standard 

Manufacturer
**$432.00

14 Solution Tank Kit Hilliard Multiflow XP HIL54027 EA As Specified 5 YR $205.00 Standard 
Manufacturer

$246.00

15 InstaFlow GenEon INT-01 EA As Specified 1 YR $6,287.00 1 YR $7,794.00
16 Trio RX GenEon TRX-01 EA As Specified 1 YR $858.00 1 YR $1,050.00
17 Mist Fogger/Blower GenEon MIST01 EA As Specified 1 YR $629.00 1 YR $738.00

18 FM-20 DS Floor Machine Tennant FM-20/9007334 EA ADV-01440A
3 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
*$1,072.50 As Specified 3YR/3YR $1,275.69

Standard 
Manufacturer

$2,004.00

19
Wet Vac VL500™ 75 ERGO 
Wet/Dry - 19 Gal. 
w/Squeegee Kit 

Advance ADV-56383408 EA ADV-56383408
5 Years Parts
2 Years Labor

180 Days Travel
$712.50

ICE iW90 Wet Vac 
w/Squeege Kit

5 YR *$650.00
Standard 

Manufacturer
$1,407.00

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

GROUP 2 - HARD FLOOR CARE (Continued)   

SE Link will email Maintenace Manager & Tyler 
Lovelace at time of delivery as well as schedule 

training and In Service at No Charge.

Battery Equipment 15% off MSRP and Cord 
Electric 20% off MSRP.

GROUP 4 - RELATED ITEMS

GROUP 3 - TRAINING/DEMONSTRATION OF EQUIPMENT

No Response

No Response

No Charge

25% Off List

Per Section 6.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has 
failed to include an item(s), responding vendors are asked to provide a 
fee structure for additional, related items that may be purchased during 
the award period.  Some example responses are:  X% discount below 
MSRP; X% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-
up.  

35% Off List

Per Section 2.4 of the Special Terms and Conditions, provide a cost and 
description for training/demonstration of equipment. $0.00 
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