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Item CCSD# Description Manufacturer Model/Manufacturer # Est. Qty. UOM Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

1 AH-004
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 50 Ea

As Specified $159.65 $7,982.50 Corbin Russwin, CL3355-NZD-626-LC $164.84 $8,242.00

2  AH-207
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder 7 Pin I.C. Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 30 Ea

As Specified $182.75 $5,482.50 Corbin Russwin, CL3355-NZD-626-CL7 $188.70 $5,661.00

3 AH-004A Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function Corbin Russwin CL3351, N2D, 626 50 Ea As Specified $159.65 $7,982.50 Corbin Russwin, CL3351-NZD-626 $188.70 $9,435.00
4 AH-006 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Less Cylinder Schlage ND70JD- RHO626 20 Ea As Specified $221.95 $4,439.00 Schlage, ND70JD-RHO-626 $239.46 $4,789.20
5 AH-124 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Standard Cylinder Schlage ND70PD- RHO626 20 Ea As Specified $248.27 $4,965.40 Schlage, ND70PD-RHO-626 $254.40 $5,088.00

6 AH-204 Sargent 60-10G37-L-L-IC-26D RH RA Cylinders, 6 Pin Sargent
60-10G37-LL-IC-26D RH RA 

Cylinders, 6 Pin 20 Ea
As Specified $182.75 $3,655.00 Sargent, 60-10G37-LL-IC-26D-RH-RA $188.70 $3,774.00

7 AH-215
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom T-Zone 
10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D  x LC Sargent 10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D x LC 20 Ea As Specified $158.35 $3,167.00 Sargent, 10G37-LP-RH-26D-LC $163.45 $3,269.00

8 AH-064 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom Standard Cylinder Yale PB5408LN 626 50 Ea As Specified $164.50 $8,225.00 Yale, PB-5408LBLB-626 $169.83 $8,491.50

9 AH-208
Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom 6 pin I.C. Cylinder, Less 
Cylinder Yale PB5408LN-626-1210-LC 50 Ea As Specified $164.50 $8,225.00 Yale, PB-5408LB-626-ICLC $169.83 $8,491.50

10 AH-064A
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function; 
Less Cylinder Yale PB5407 LN626 60 Ea As Specified $146.50 $8,790.00 Yale, PB-5407LN-626-LC $151.24 $9,074.40

11 AH-068 Lockset, Cylindrical, Knob-Type, Classroom, 26D Yale 5408-LH-26D 36 Ea As Specified $139.75 $5,031.00 Yale, CA-5408CK-LH-26D $144.30 $5,194.80

12 AH-049
Lockset, Cylindrical, Deadbolt Triple Action Bolt 626 
Finish, C123 Cylinder Schlage BC560P6 626 C123 30 Ea

As Specified $26.74 $802.20 Schlage, B560P6-626-C123 $35.28 $1,058.40

13 AH-018
Deadbolt Classroom Function Cylindrical Single 
Cylinder Thumb Turn 626 Finish Corbin Russwin DL3017-D1 30 Ea

As Specified $91.50 $2,745.00 Corbin Russwin, DL3017-D1-626 $91.41 $2,742.30

14 AH-071
Install-A-Lock for 1 ¾” Door, Finish US32D, Satin 
stainless steel, 2 3/4" Backset Don-Jo

4 2 CW-S or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 25 Ea

As Specified $7.85 $196.25 Don Jo, 4-2-CW-S $14.74 $368.50

15 AH-093 Padlock, Keyed Different Masterlock Size #1 KD 100 Ea As Specified $6.14 $614.00 Masterlock, 1-KD $5.86 $586.00
16 AH-093A Padlock, Series SR121, Keyed to 10545 Masterlock 1KAMKW1RSV 300 Ea As Specified $13.00 $3,900.00 Masterlock, 1KAMKW1RSV $12.42 $3,726.00
17 AH-093B Padlock, Series SR121 Rekeyable Masterlock  21KZW1RSV 100 Ea As Specified $12.65 $1,265.00 Masterlock, 21KZW1RSV $12.09 $1,209.00
18 AH-094 Padlock, Rekeyable 2 1/2" Shackle Masterlock 21KZW1RSV LJ 30 Ea As Specified $13.75 $412.50 Masterlock, 21KZW1RSVLJ $13.15 $394.50
19 AH-095 Padlock, Rekeyable 6" Schakle Masterlock 21KALN 30 Ea As Specified $12.63 $378.90 Masterlock, 21KALN $12.07 $362.10

20 AH-037 Plate, Push, 4” x 16”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80S or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea Don-Jo 71-628 $3.95 $118.50 Don Jo, 78-US26D $20.01 $600.30

21 AH-038 Plate, Pull, 3.5” x 15”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea
Don-Jo 7011-628 $9.64 $289.20 Don Jo, 77-US26D $19.77 $593.10

22 AH-062 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Yale 54BC   150 Ea As Specified $69.25 $10,387.50 Yale, 54BC-689 $70.49 $10,573.50
23 AH-043 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible LCN LCN #4041 50 Ea As Specified $236.26 $11,813.00 LCN, 4040XP-RW/PA-689 $246.75 $12,337.50
24 AH-047 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Left Hand LCN LCN #4111 20 Ea As Specified $229.51 $4,590.20 LCN, 4111-EDA-689-LH $239.70 $4,794.00

25 AH-048 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Right Hand LCN LCN #4111 50 Ea
As Specified $229.51 $11,475.50 LCN, 4111-EDA-689-RH $239.70 $11,985.00

26 AH-046 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Corbin Russwin COR-DC2210-689-M54 50 Ea New Part #DC6210-689-M54 $131.50 $6,575.00 Corbin Russwin, DC3210-689-M54 $117.11 $5,855.50

27 AH-152 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 6’8” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea No Bid $407.76 $12,232.80

28 AH-153 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 7’0” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea
No Bid $417.12 $12,513.60

29 AH-200 Door Stop, Kick Down, Ives BP 455 A3 800 Ea As Specified $3.56 $2,848.00 Ives, FS455-4-US27 $3.65 $2,920.00
30 AH-079 Door Stop, Dome, Half Moon, Floor Mount Ives FS436 US26 300 Ea As Specified $2.48 $744.00 Ives, FS436-US26 $3.16 $948.00
31 AH-070 Latch Guard 3 1/4" x 10" Don-Jo BLP-110 Stainless Steel 40 Ea As Specified $10.30 $412.00 Don Jo, BLP-110-630 $13.51 $540.40

Vendor:
Terms:

Accredited Lock and Door Hardware Co., dba Accredited Lock Supply Co.
Net 30

DH Pace Co. Inc.
Net 30
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Vendor:
Terms:

Accredited Lock and Door Hardware Co., dba Accredited Lock Supply Co.
Net 30

DH Pace Co. Inc.
Net 30

32 AH-088
Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Classroom Grade 2 (NON-
Freewheeling/ Non-Clutch) LSDA L150, 26D 200 Ea No Bid No Bid

33 AH-205 Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Privacy Grade 2 LSDA L120, 26D 20 Ea No Bid No Bid
34 AH-201 Cylinder for LSDA Type Lock #K001-SC-26D-0B  200 Ea As Specified $5.20 $1,040.00 No Bid
35 AH202 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/8"  50 Ea No Bid No Bid
36 AH-203 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/4"  50 Ea No Bid No Bid
37 AH-088A Leverset, Passage, 26D Finish, 2 ¾” Backset LSDA LSL110, 26D 50 Ea No Bid No Bid
38 AH-165 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 3 ½”, Zinc Plated 75 Ea No Bid No Bid
39 AH-166 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 4 ½” 36 Ea No Bid No Bid

40 AH-170
Hinge Set 3”, Butt Type (2 hinges with screws) Alum. 
Finish National

N142-604 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 30 Set No Bid No Bid

41 AH-173 Hinge, 4”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 30 Set
Stanley FBB179-4x4-26D $4.60 $138.00 Hager, BB1279 4 x 4 US26D $6.70 $201.00

42 AH-174 Hinge, 4 ½”, Offset Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Stanley
FBB112, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 150 Ea
As Specified $41.90 $6,285.00 Stanley, FBB112 4.5 US26D $39.91 $5,986.50

43 AH-175 Hinge, 4 ½”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 60 Ea
Stanley FBB179-4.5x4.5-26D $3.60 $216.00 Hager, BB1279 4.5 x 4.5 US26D $3.43 $205.80

44 AH-198 Lite Vision Frame, Steel, 7” X 22” Rough Opening 75 Ea National Guard L-FRA100-7x22 $31.70 $2,377.50 NGP L-FRA100 $41.50 $3,112.50
45 AH-199 Kick Plate, 8” x 34", 18 gauge stainless steel 20 Ea As Specified $12.50 $250.00 Don Jo, 90-630 $13.36 $267.20
46 AH-076 Exit Device Panic : Not Fire Rated Von Duprin 98EO-US26D 20 Ea As Specified $654.00 $13,080.00 Von Duprin, 98EO-3'-US26D $676.33 $13,526.60
47 AH-209 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-NL  20 Ea As Specified $124.20 $2,484.00 Ives, VR910NL-US32D $127.31 $2,546.20
48 AH-210 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-DT  20 Ea As Specified $124.20 $2,484.00 Ives, VR910DT-US32D $127.31 $2,546.20

49 AH-084 Barrell Bolt, 8” Heavy Duty; Zinc Plated National
N151-167 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 10 Ea No Bid No Bid

50 AH-083A Barrel Bolt, 3”, Finish 606 Stanley
ST4C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 75 Ea No Bid No Bid

51 AH-167 Hasp, 6” Zinc Plated National
N102-459 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 20 Ea No Bid No Bid

52 AH-042 Magnetic door holdback Rixon
 998 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 12 Ea As Specified $124.20 $1,490.40 Rixson, 998M $132.16 $1,585.92

53 AH-168 Pivot Hinge, Left Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea Adams Rite B1923 $38.95 $934.80 Hager, 253-US2C-LH $41.05 $985.20

54 AH-169 Pivot Hinge, Right Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea Adams Rite B1923 $38.95 $934.80 Hager, 253-US2C-RH $41.05 $985.20

55 AH-214 4 Way Lock Lube 11oz Can Houdini CER-11101 60 Ea No Bid Houdini, CER-11101 $7.73 $463.80

56 AH-216
Schlage Office Function Mortise Lock, Less cylinder, 
Handle Style 06, Rose A, 626 Finish Schlage L9050L x 06A x 626 50 Ea

As Specified $336.00 $16,800.00 Schlage, L9050L-06A-626 $340.30 $17,015.00

57 AH-220 Rim Cylinder FSIC Housing, 626 finish, Less Core Schlage 20-079 20 Ea As Specified $26.10 $522.00 Schlage, 20-079 $26.56 $531.20
58 AH-221 Standard Rim Strike, with screws and strike plate Von Duprin 299 30 Ea As Specified $28.75 $862.50 Von Duprin, 299-US26D $35.25 $1,057.50

59 AH-177
Hinge, 4.5" 5 knuckle Heavy Weight Full mortise butt 
hinge

Hager BB1168 20 Ea Stanley FBB168-4.5 $9.90 $198.00 Hager, BB1168 4.5 x 4.5 US26D $10.53 $210.60

60 AH-219 Top Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050335 20 Ea As Specified $32.40 $648.00 Von Dupin, 050335-SP28 $33.37 $667.40
61 AH-217 Bottom Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050390 20 Ea As Specified $31.50 $630.00 Von Duprin, 050390-SP28 $32.43 $648.60
62 AH-218 Key Removable Mullion Top Fitting Von Duprin 971340 20 Ea As Specified $48.85 $977.00 Von Dupin, 971340-SP28 $50.29 $1,005.80

63 AH-222
Yale 1109 Rim cylinder - 1145 tail piece - PA keyway 
(NOT PARA)

Yale 1109 x 1145 x PA 75 Ea As Specified $30.75 $2,306.25 Yale, 1109-1145-PA $29.26 $2,194.50
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Vendor:
Terms:

Accredited Lock and Door Hardware Co., dba Accredited Lock Supply Co.
Net 30

DH Pace Co. Inc.
Net 30

64 AH-223
Von Duprin Night latch trim for 98 series exit device, 
US26D Finish

Von Duprin 990NL-R/V, US26D 50 Ea As Specified $128.35 $6,417.50 Von Duprin, 990NL-R/V-US26D $132.07 $6,603.50

65 Non Stock
Von Duprin Key Removable Mullion retrofit kit Non 
Stock School Purchase Only

Von Duprin 050168 10 Ea As Specified $235.20 $2,352.00 Von Duprin, 050168-SP28 $242.05 $2,420.50

66 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Catch Plate Don Jo MH C Chrome 20 Ea As Specified $11.40 $228.00 Don Jo, MH C Chrome $12.52 $250.40
67 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Swivel Base Don Jo MH SB Chrome 20 Ea As Specified $32.00 $640.00 Don Jo, MH SB Chrome $35.16 $703.20
68 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1/2" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E .5 Chrome 15 Ea As Specified $7.25 $108.75 Don Jo, MH E .5 Chrome $7.96 $119.40
69 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 1 Chrome 15 Ea As Specified $7.25 $108.75 Don Jo, MH 1 Chrome $7.96 $119.40
70 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 3" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 3 Chrome 10 Ea As Specified $9.05 $90.50 Don Jo, MH 3 Chrome $9.95 $99.50

71 New
Ives Full mortise, aluminum geared continuous hinge 
with door edge protector, 83"

Ives 224HD 83" US28 15 Ea As Specified $81.95 $1,229.25 Ives, 224HD-83"-US28 $83.97 $1,259.55

72 New
Ives Full surface, pin and barrel continuous hinge - 
steel, 83"

Ives 602 83" 600 15 Ea As Specified $145.65 $2,184.75 Ives, 602-83"-600 $149.28 $2,239.20

73 New
Stainless steel continuous hinge for restroom partition 
doors, without spring 57 1/2"

Generic #7649 15 Ea No Bid No Bid

tion
Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms and Conditions, responding vendors are asked to provide a guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for 
related items purchased during the contract period not noted in this solicitation.

Discount

40% - 60%

Discount

45%



Tabsheet Cobb County School District
IFB B2042, Door Hardware

Page 4 of 9

Item CCSD# Description Manufacturer Model/Manufacturer # Est. Qty. UOM

1 AH-004
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 50 Ea

2  AH-207
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder 7 Pin I.C. Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 30 Ea

3 AH-004A Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function Corbin Russwin CL3351, N2D, 626 50 Ea
4 AH-006 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Less Cylinder Schlage ND70JD- RHO626 20 Ea
5 AH-124 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Standard Cylinder Schlage ND70PD- RHO626 20 Ea

6 AH-204 Sargent 60-10G37-L-L-IC-26D RH RA Cylinders, 6 Pin Sargent
60-10G37-LL-IC-26D RH RA 

Cylinders, 6 Pin 20 Ea

7 AH-215
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom T-Zone 
10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D  x LC Sargent 10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D x LC 20 Ea

8 AH-064 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom Standard Cylinder Yale PB5408LN 626 50 Ea

9 AH-208
Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom 6 pin I.C. Cylinder, Less 
Cylinder Yale PB5408LN-626-1210-LC 50 Ea

10 AH-064A
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function; 
Less Cylinder Yale PB5407 LN626 60 Ea

11 AH-068 Lockset, Cylindrical, Knob-Type, Classroom, 26D Yale 5408-LH-26D 36 Ea

12 AH-049
Lockset, Cylindrical, Deadbolt Triple Action Bolt 626 
Finish, C123 Cylinder Schlage BC560P6 626 C123 30 Ea

13 AH-018
Deadbolt Classroom Function Cylindrical Single 
Cylinder Thumb Turn 626 Finish Corbin Russwin DL3017-D1 30 Ea

14 AH-071
Install-A-Lock for 1 ¾” Door, Finish US32D, Satin 
stainless steel, 2 3/4" Backset Don-Jo

4 2 CW-S or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 25 Ea

15 AH-093 Padlock, Keyed Different Masterlock Size #1 KD 100 Ea
16 AH-093A Padlock, Series SR121, Keyed to 10545 Masterlock 1KAMKW1RSV 300 Ea
17 AH-093B Padlock, Series SR121 Rekeyable Masterlock  21KZW1RSV 100 Ea
18 AH-094 Padlock, Rekeyable 2 1/2" Shackle Masterlock 21KZW1RSV LJ 30 Ea
19 AH-095 Padlock, Rekeyable 6" Schakle Masterlock 21KALN 30 Ea

20 AH-037 Plate, Push, 4” x 16”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80S or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea

21 AH-038 Plate, Pull, 3.5” x 15”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea
22 AH-062 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Yale 54BC   150 Ea
23 AH-043 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible LCN LCN #4041 50 Ea
24 AH-047 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Left Hand LCN LCN #4111 20 Ea

25 AH-048 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Right Hand LCN LCN #4111 50 Ea
26 AH-046 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Corbin Russwin COR-DC2210-689-M54 50 Ea

27 AH-152 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 6’8” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea

28 AH-153 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 7’0” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea
29 AH-200 Door Stop, Kick Down, Ives BP 455 A3 800 Ea
30 AH-079 Door Stop, Dome, Half Moon, Floor Mount Ives FS436 US26 300 Ea
31 AH-070 Latch Guard 3 1/4" x 10" Don-Jo BLP-110 Stainless Steel 40 Ea

Vendor:
Terms:

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

as specified $190.11 $9,505.50 NO BID

as specified $190.11 $5,703.30 NO BID

as specified $190.11 $9,505.50 NO BID
as specified $264.00 $5,280.00 SCHLAGE# ND70JD-RHO-626 $238.36 $4,767.20
as specified $280.31 $5,606.20 SCHLAGE# ND70PD-RHO-626 $253.24 $5,064.80

as specified $190.44 $3,808.80 NO BID

as specified $164.67 $3,293.40 NO BID

as specified $171.10 $8,555.00 NO BID

as specified $188.48 $9,424.00 NO BID

as specified $171.10 $10,266.00 NO BID

as specified $171.10 $6,159.60 NO BID

as specified $39.00 $1,170.00 SCHLAGE# B560P-626 C123 $34.99 $1,049.70

as specified $102.00 $3,060.00 NO BID

as specified $7.80 $195.00 DON JO# 4-S-2-CW $7.88 $197.00

as specified $6.14 $614.00 MASTER# 1 $5.85 $585.00
as specified $13.00 $3,900.00 MASTER# 1KAMKW1RSV 10545-SR121 $12.49 $3,747.00
as specified $12.65 $1,265.00 MASTER# 21KZW1RSV $12.16 $1,216.00
as specified $13.74 $412.20 MASTER# 21LJKZW1RSV $13.23 $396.90
as specified $12.61 $378.30 MASTER# 21KALN $12.24 $367.20

as specified $33.47 $1,004.10 DON JO# 71-628 $4.19 $125.70

as specified $38.00 $1,140.00 DON JO# 7010-628 $10.13 $303.90

as specified $71.00 $10,650.00 NORTON# 1604BC-689 $49.45 $7,417.50
as specified $266.75 $13,337.50 LCN# 4040XP-RW/PA-689-TBSRT $235.89 $11,794.50
as specified $260.00 $5,200.00 LCN# 4111-EDA-689-LH-TBSRT $231.56 $4,631.20

as specified $260.00 $13,000.00 LCN# 4111-EDA-689-RH-TBSRT $231.56 $11,578.00

as specified $130.00 $6,500.00 NO BID
as specified - each price but must be 

ordered in multiples of 10
$315.00 $9,450.00 NO BID

as specified - each price but must be 
ordered in multiples of 10

$315.00 $9,450.00 NO BID

Ives FS455 $16.03 $12,824.00 IVES# FS455-4-US3AL $3.77 $3,016.00
as specified $4.00 $1,200.00 IVES# FS436-US26 $3.39 $1,017.00
as specified $12.85 $514.00 DON JO# BLP-110-630 $10.24 $409.60

IDN Global, Inc. dba IDN-Armstrong, Inc.
Net 30

Independent Hardware Inc.
Net 30
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Vendor:
Terms:

32 AH-088
Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Classroom Grade 2 (NON-
Freewheeling/ Non-Clutch) LSDA L150, 26D 200 Ea

33 AH-205 Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Privacy Grade 2 LSDA L120, 26D 20 Ea
34 AH-201 Cylinder for LSDA Type Lock #K001-SC-26D-0B  200 Ea
35 AH202 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/8"  50 Ea
36 AH-203 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/4"  50 Ea
37 AH-088A Leverset, Passage, 26D Finish, 2 ¾” Backset LSDA LSL110, 26D 50 Ea
38 AH-165 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 3 ½”, Zinc Plated 75 Ea
39 AH-166 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 4 ½” 36 Ea

40 AH-170
Hinge Set 3”, Butt Type (2 hinges with screws) Alum. 
Finish National

N142-604 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 30 Set

41 AH-173 Hinge, 4”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 30 Set

42 AH-174 Hinge, 4 ½”, Offset Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Stanley
FBB112, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 150 Ea

43 AH-175 Hinge, 4 ½”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 60 Ea
44 AH-198 Lite Vision Frame, Steel, 7” X 22” Rough Opening 75 Ea
45 AH-199 Kick Plate, 8” x 34", 18 gauge stainless steel 20 Ea
46 AH-076 Exit Device Panic : Not Fire Rated Von Duprin 98EO-US26D 20 Ea
47 AH-209 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-NL  20 Ea
48 AH-210 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-DT  20 Ea

49 AH-084 Barrell Bolt, 8” Heavy Duty; Zinc Plated National
N151-167 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 10 Ea

50 AH-083A Barrel Bolt, 3”, Finish 606 Stanley
ST4C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 75 Ea

51 AH-167 Hasp, 6” Zinc Plated National
N102-459 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 20 Ea

52 AH-042 Magnetic door holdback Rixon
 998 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 12 Ea

53 AH-168 Pivot Hinge, Left Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea

54 AH-169 Pivot Hinge, Right Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea
55 AH-214 4 Way Lock Lube 11oz Can Houdini CER-11101 60 Ea

56 AH-216
Schlage Office Function Mortise Lock, Less cylinder, 
Handle Style 06, Rose A, 626 Finish Schlage L9050L x 06A x 626 50 Ea

57 AH-220 Rim Cylinder FSIC Housing, 626 finish, Less Core Schlage 20-079 20 Ea
58 AH-221 Standard Rim Strike, with screws and strike plate Von Duprin 299 30 Ea

59 AH-177
Hinge, 4.5" 5 knuckle Heavy Weight Full mortise butt 
hinge

Hager BB1168 20 Ea

60 AH-219 Top Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050335 20 Ea
61 AH-217 Bottom Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050390 20 Ea
62 AH-218 Key Removable Mullion Top Fitting Von Duprin 971340 20 Ea

63 AH-222
Yale 1109 Rim cylinder - 1145 tail piece - PA keyway 
(NOT PARA)

Yale 1109 x 1145 x PA 75 Ea

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

IDN Global, Inc. dba IDN-Armstrong, Inc.
Net 30

Independent Hardware Inc.
Net 30

as specified $27.50 $5,500.00 NO BID

as specified $24.50 $490.00 NO BID
as specified $5.78 $1,156.00 NO BID
as specified $3.20 $160.00 NO BID
as specified $3.20 $160.00 NO BID
as specified $24.50 $1,225.00 NO BID

11235 PARKER $3.00 $225.00 IHI# 3.5" HASP $1.75 $131.25
11245 PARKER $4.00 $144.00 IHI# 4.5" HASP $2.75 $99.00

as specified $37.80 $1,134.00 NATIONAL# N142-604 $2.75 $82.50

as specified $7.36 $220.80 HAGER# BB1279-4" X 4"-26D $13.89 $416.70

as specified $75.00 $11,250.00 STANLEY# FBB112-4.5"-26D $46.34 $6,951.00

as specified $5.00 $300.00 HAGER# BB1279-4.5" X 4.5"-26D $3.37 $202.20

as specified $131.20 $9,840.00 NO BID
as specified $16.88 $337.60 DON JO# 90-630 8" X 34" $14.68 $293.60
as specified $752.00 $15,040.00 VON DUPRIN# 98EO-US26D-36" $663.74 $13,274.80
as specified $111.00 $2,220.00 IVES# VR910-NL-32D $131.65 $2,633.00
as specified $111.00 $2,220.00 IVES# VR910-DT-32D $131.65 $2,633.00

no bid NATIONAL# N151-167 $9.76 $97.60

no bid NO BID

no bid NATIONAL# N102-459 $4.36 $87.20

as specified $131.00 $1,572.00 NO BID

as specified $75.23 $1,805.52 HAGER# 253-US2C $41.43 $994.32

as specified $75.23 $1,805.52 HAGER# 253-US2C $41.43 $994.32

as specified $4.99 $299.40 NO BID

as specified $382.10 $19,105.00 SCHLAGE# L9050L-06A-626 $346.23 $17,311.50

as specified $30.11 $602.20 SCHLAGE# 20-079-626 $26.86 $537.20
as specified $38.84 $1,165.20 VON DUPRIN# 299-US19 $29.99 $899.70

bb1168X usp (prime coated) $15.05 $301.00 HAGER# BB1168-4.5" X 4.5"-US26D $10.63 $212.60

as specified $37.11 $742.20 VON DUPRIN# 050335-SP28 $35.15 $703.00
as specified $36.07 $721.40 VON DUPRIN# 050390-SP28 $34.16 $683.20
as specified $57.00 $1,140.00 VON DUPRIN# 971340-SP28 $52.97 $1,059.40

as specified $28.08 $2,106.00 NO BID
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Item CCSD# Description Manufacturer Model/Manufacturer # Est. Qty. UOM
      

    

Vendor:
Terms:

64 AH-223
Von Duprin Night latch trim for 98 series exit device, 
US26D Finish

Von Duprin 990NL-R/V, US26D 50 Ea

65 Non Stock
Von Duprin Key Removable Mullion retrofit kit Non 
Stock School Purchase Only

Von Duprin 050168 10 Ea

66 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Catch Plate Don Jo MH C Chrome 20 Ea
67 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Swivel Base Don Jo MH SB Chrome 20 Ea
68 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1/2" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E .5 Chrome 15 Ea
69 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 1 Chrome 15 Ea
70 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 3" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 3 Chrome 10 Ea

71 New
Ives Full mortise, aluminum geared continuous hinge 
with door edge protector, 83"

Ives 224HD 83" US28 15 Ea

72 New
Ives Full surface, pin and barrel continuous hinge - 
steel, 83"

Ives 602 83" 600 15 Ea

73 New
Stainless steel continuous hinge for restroom partition 
doors, without spring 57 1/2"

Generic #7649 15 Ea

tion
Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms and Conditions, responding vendors are asked to provide a guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for 
related items purchased during the contract period not noted in this solicitation.

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

IDN Global, Inc. dba IDN-Armstrong, Inc.
Net 30

Independent Hardware Inc.
Net 30

as specified $145.50 $7,275.00 VON DUPRIN# 990NL-R/V-26D $132.14 $6,607.00

as specified $269.13 $2,691.30 VON DUPRIN# 050168-SP28 $244.50 $2,445.00

no bid NO BID
no bid NO BID
no bid NO BID
no bid NO BID
no bid NO BID

as specified $80.00 $1,200.00 IVES# 224HD-83"-US28 $90.11 $1,351.65

as specified $140.00 $2,100.00 IVES# 602-83"-600 $170.40 $2,556.00

no Bid NO BID

Discount

45%

Discount

50%
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Item CCSD# Description Manufacturer Model/Manufacturer # Est. Qty. UOM

1 AH-004
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 50 Ea

2  AH-207
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom Function; 
Less Cylinder 7 Pin I.C. Corbin Russwin CL3355, NZD, 626 30 Ea

3 AH-004A Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function Corbin Russwin CL3351, N2D, 626 50 Ea
4 AH-006 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Less Cylinder Schlage ND70JD- RHO626 20 Ea
5 AH-124 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom, Standard Cylinder Schlage ND70PD- RHO626 20 Ea

6 AH-204 Sargent 60-10G37-L-L-IC-26D RH RA Cylinders, 6 Pin Sargent
60-10G37-LL-IC-26D RH RA 

Cylinders, 6 Pin 20 Ea

7 AH-215
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Classroom T-Zone 
10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D  x LC Sargent 10G37 x L x P x RH x 26D x LC 20 Ea

8 AH-064 Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom Standard Cylinder Yale PB5408LN 626 50 Ea

9 AH-208
Lockset, Lever Type, Classroom 6 pin I.C. Cylinder, Less 
Cylinder Yale PB5408LN-626-1210-LC 50 Ea

10 AH-064A
Lockset, Cylindrical, Lever Type, Entrance Function; 
Less Cylinder Yale PB5407 LN626 60 Ea

11 AH-068 Lockset, Cylindrical, Knob-Type, Classroom, 26D Yale 5408-LH-26D 36 Ea

12 AH-049
Lockset, Cylindrical, Deadbolt Triple Action Bolt 626 
Finish, C123 Cylinder Schlage BC560P6 626 C123 30 Ea

13 AH-018
Deadbolt Classroom Function Cylindrical Single 
Cylinder Thumb Turn 626 Finish Corbin Russwin DL3017-D1 30 Ea

14 AH-071
Install-A-Lock for 1 ¾” Door, Finish US32D, Satin 
stainless steel, 2 3/4" Backset Don-Jo

4 2 CW-S or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 25 Ea

15 AH-093 Padlock, Keyed Different Masterlock Size #1 KD 100 Ea
16 AH-093A Padlock, Series SR121, Keyed to 10545 Masterlock 1KAMKW1RSV 300 Ea
17 AH-093B Padlock, Series SR121 Rekeyable Masterlock  21KZW1RSV 100 Ea
18 AH-094 Padlock, Rekeyable 2 1/2" Shackle Masterlock 21KZW1RSV LJ 30 Ea
19 AH-095 Padlock, Rekeyable 6" Schakle Masterlock 21KALN 30 Ea

20 AH-037 Plate, Push, 4” x 16”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80S or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea

21 AH-038 Plate, Pull, 3.5” x 15”, Aluminum US26D Hager
Hager Series 80 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent 30 Ea
22 AH-062 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Yale 54BC   150 Ea
23 AH-043 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible LCN LCN #4041 50 Ea
24 AH-047 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Left Hand LCN LCN #4111 20 Ea

25 AH-048 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Right Hand LCN LCN #4111 50 Ea
26 AH-046 Door Closer, Hydraulic, Non-Hold-Open, Reversible Corbin Russwin COR-DC2210-689-M54 50 Ea

27 AH-152 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 6’8” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea

28 AH-153 Door, Stave Core, Ext. 3’0” x 7’0” x 1 ¾” Birch Veneer 30 Ea
29 AH-200 Door Stop, Kick Down, Ives BP 455 A3 800 Ea
30 AH-079 Door Stop, Dome, Half Moon, Floor Mount Ives FS436 US26 300 Ea
31 AH-070 Latch Guard 3 1/4" x 10" Don-Jo BLP-110 Stainless Steel 40 Ea

Vendor:
Terms:

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

Bid as specified $165.89 $8,294.50 Bid As Specified MSC # 98944226 $261.56 $13,078.00

Bid as specified $165.89 $4,976.70 Bid As Specified MSC # 98944382 $302.99 $9,089.70

Bid as specified $192.17 $9,608.50 Bid As Specified MSC # 98945264 $301.35 $15,067.50
Bid as specified $259.66 $5,193.20 Bid As Specified MSC # 96315627 $452.70 $9,054.00
Bid as specified $275.86 $5,517.20 Bid As Specified MSC # 96315692 $277.73 $5,554.60

Bid as specified $192.17 $3,843.40 Bid As Specified MSC # 98947526 $302.99 $6,059.80

Bid as specified $166.46 $3,329.20 Bid As Specified MSC# 98950207 $264.44 $5,288.80

Bid as specified $172.95 $8,647.50 Bid As Specified MSC#  98953227 $271.21 $13,560.50

Bid as specified $172.95 $8,647.50 No Bid

Bid as specified $154.02 $9,241.20 Bid As Specified MSC# 98953714  $271.21 $16,272.60

Bid as specified $146.95 $5,290.20 No Bid

Bid as specified $38.26 $1,147.80 No Bid

Bid as specified $93.34 $2,800.20 Bid As Specified MSC# 98928609  $152.01 $4,560.30

Bid as specified $10.00 $250.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  12280731 $23.46 $586.50

Bid as specified $6.50 $650.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  01244359 $10.42 $1,042.00
Bid as specified $12.80 $3,840.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  96313655 $19.56 $5,868.00
Bid as specified $13.05 $1,305.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  96313820  $18.89 $1,889.00
Bid as specified $14.25 $427.50 Bid As Specified MSC#  96314273 $23.78 $713.40
Bid as specified $13.05 $391.50 Bid As Specified MSC# 86132693 $24.02 $720.60

Bid as specified $13.99 $419.70 No Bid

Bid as specified $29.68 $890.40 No Bid

Bid as specified $71.50 $10,725.00 No Bid
Bid as specified $210.00 $10,500.00 No Bid
Bid as specified $255.00 $5,100.00 Bid As Specified MSC# 57311532   $258.53 $5,170.60

Bid as specified $255.00 $12,750.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  57311508 $258.53 $12,926.50

Bid as specified $134.04 $6,702.00 No Bid

Unable to supply No Bid

Unable to supply No Bid

Bid as specified $4.00 $3,200.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  98944812 $4.39 $3,512.00
Bid as specified $3.47 $1,041.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  98955347 $4.43 $1,329.00
Bid as specified $11.47 $458.80 Bid As Specified MSC#  12283198 $21.51 $860.40

Sid Tool Co., Inc. dba MSC Industrial Supply Co.
Net 30

Lockmasters Inc.
Net 30
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Item CCSD# Description Manufacturer Model/Manufacturer # Est. Qty. UOM
      

    

Vendor:
Terms:

32 AH-088
Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Classroom Grade 2 (NON-
Freewheeling/ Non-Clutch) LSDA L150, 26D 200 Ea

33 AH-205 Lockset, Cylindrical, Leverset, Privacy Grade 2 LSDA L120, 26D 20 Ea
34 AH-201 Cylinder for LSDA Type Lock #K001-SC-26D-0B  200 Ea
35 AH202 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/8"  50 Ea
36 AH-203 Dead Latch, Latch Bolt 2 3/4"  50 Ea
37 AH-088A Leverset, Passage, 26D Finish, 2 ¾” Backset LSDA LSL110, 26D 50 Ea
38 AH-165 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 3 ½”, Zinc Plated 75 Ea
39 AH-166 Hasp, Safety Hasp, 4 ½” 36 Ea

40 AH-170
Hinge Set 3”, Butt Type (2 hinges with screws) Alum. 
Finish National

N142-604 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent 30 Set

41 AH-173 Hinge, 4”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 30 Set

42 AH-174 Hinge, 4 ½”, Offset Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Stanley
FBB112, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 150 Ea

43 AH-175 Hinge, 4 ½”, Butt Five Knuckle, Ball Bearing  US26D Hager
BB1279, or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 60 Ea
44 AH-198 Lite Vision Frame, Steel, 7” X 22” Rough Opening 75 Ea
45 AH-199 Kick Plate, 8” x 34", 18 gauge stainless steel 20 Ea
46 AH-076 Exit Device Panic : Not Fire Rated Von Duprin 98EO-US26D 20 Ea
47 AH-209 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-NL  20 Ea
48 AH-210 Vandel Type Trim Kit Ives VR910-DT  20 Ea

49 AH-084 Barrell Bolt, 8” Heavy Duty; Zinc Plated National
N151-167 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 10 Ea

50 AH-083A Barrel Bolt, 3”, Finish 606 Stanley
ST4C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 75 Ea

51 AH-167 Hasp, 6” Zinc Plated National
N102-459 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 20 Ea

52 AH-042 Magnetic door holdback Rixon
 998 or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 12 Ea

53 AH-168 Pivot Hinge, Left Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea

54 AH-169 Pivot Hinge, Right Hand 3/4"   Hager
253 US2C or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent 24 Ea
55 AH-214 4 Way Lock Lube 11oz Can Houdini CER-11101 60 Ea

56 AH-216
Schlage Office Function Mortise Lock, Less cylinder, 
Handle Style 06, Rose A, 626 Finish Schlage L9050L x 06A x 626 50 Ea

57 AH-220 Rim Cylinder FSIC Housing, 626 finish, Less Core Schlage 20-079 20 Ea
58 AH-221 Standard Rim Strike, with screws and strike plate Von Duprin 299 30 Ea

59 AH-177
Hinge, 4.5" 5 knuckle Heavy Weight Full mortise butt 
hinge

Hager BB1168 20 Ea

60 AH-219 Top Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050335 20 Ea
61 AH-217 Bottom Mullion Fitting Set Von Duprin 050390 20 Ea
62 AH-218 Key Removable Mullion Top Fitting Von Duprin 971340 20 Ea

63 AH-222
Yale 1109 Rim cylinder - 1145 tail piece - PA keyway 
(NOT PARA)

Yale 1109 x 1145 x PA 75 Ea

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

Sid Tool Co., Inc. dba MSC Industrial Supply Co.
Net 30

Lockmasters Inc.
Net 30

Dexter C2000-CLRM-R-626-KDC $33.62 $6,724.00 No Bid

Dexter C2000-PRIV-R-626 $29.64 $592.80 No Bid
ILCO 15995SC-26D-0B $5.75 $1,150.00 No Bid
Dexter C2000-DL-630 $4.00 $200.00 No Bid

Dexter C2000-DL-234-630 $4.00 $200.00 No Bid
Dexter C2000-PASS-R-626 $27.50 $1,375.00 No Bid

Unable to supply No Bid
Unable to supply No Bid

Unable to supply Bid As Specified MSC#  42517417 $3.83 $114.90

Bid as specified $8.61 $258.30 No Bid

Bid as specified $44.35 $6,652.50 Bid As Specified MSC#  98951593 $66.39 $9,958.50

Bid as specified $4.69 $281.40 No Bid

Unable to supply No Bid
Bid as specified $13.95 $279.00 No Bid
Bid as specified $607.58 $12,151.60 No Bid
Bid as specified $113.86 $2,277.20 Bid As Specified MSC#  98930076 $154.41 $3,088.20
Bid as specified $113.86 $2,277.20 Bid As Specified MSC#  98930126  $149.94 $2,998.80

Unable to supply Bid As Specified MSC#  71983225 $13.98 $139.80

Unable to supply No Bid

Master Lock 706D $6.23 $124.60 Bid As Specified MSC#  41702911 $6.23 $124.60

Bid as specified $134.72 $1,616.64 Bid As Specified MSC#  98947450  $214.64 $2,575.68

Bid as specified $52.72 $1,265.28 Bid As Specified MSC#  98929318 $79.55 $1,909.20

Bid as specified $52.72 $1,265.28 Bid As Specified MSC#  98929367 $79.55 $1,909.20

Bid as specified $4.50 $270.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $369.00 $18,450.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  98951320 $457.73 $22,886.50

Bid as specified $28.80 $576.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  41775966 $122.23 $2,444.60
Bid as specified $29.99 $899.70 No Bid

Bid as specified $12.50 $250.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $35.50 $710.00 No Bid
Bid as specified $35.00 $700.00 No Bid
Bid as specified $53.50 $1,070.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $31.66 $2,374.50 No Bid
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Vendor:
Terms:

64 AH-223
Von Duprin Night latch trim for 98 series exit device, 
US26D Finish

Von Duprin 990NL-R/V, US26D 50 Ea

65 Non Stock
Von Duprin Key Removable Mullion retrofit kit Non 
Stock School Purchase Only

Von Duprin 050168 10 Ea

66 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Catch Plate Don Jo MH C Chrome 20 Ea
67 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder Swivel Base Don Jo MH SB Chrome 20 Ea
68 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1/2" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E .5 Chrome 15 Ea
69 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 1" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 1 Chrome 15 Ea
70 New Don Jo Magnetic Door Holder 3" Extension Rod Don Jo MH E 3 Chrome 10 Ea

71 New
Ives Full mortise, aluminum geared continuous hinge 
with door edge protector, 83"

Ives 224HD 83" US28 15 Ea

72 New
Ives Full surface, pin and barrel continuous hinge - 
steel, 83"

Ives 602 83" 600 15 Ea

73 New
Stainless steel continuous hinge for restroom partition 
doors, without spring 57 1/2"

Generic #7649 15 Ea

tion
Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms and Conditions, responding vendors are asked to provide a guaranteed percentage discount below MSRP for 
related items purchased during the contract period not noted in this solicitation.

Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer/Model and Part # Unit Price Extended Price

Sid Tool Co., Inc. dba MSC Industrial Supply Co.
Net 30

Lockmasters Inc.
Net 30

Bid as specified $118.64 $5,932.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $257.50 $2,575.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $12.59 $251.80 Bid As Specified MSC# 12278321  $20.23 $404.60
Bid as specified $35.35 $707.00 Bid As Specified MSC# 12279865 $51.97 $1,039.40
Bid as specified $8.00 $120.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  12279907 $13.93 $208.95
Bid as specified $8.00 $120.00 Bid As Specified MSC#  12279949  $13.93 $208.95
Bid as specified $10.02 $100.20 Bid As Specified MSC#  12280012 $17.42 $174.20

Bid as specified $76.80 $1,152.00 No Bid

Bid as specified $133.50 $2,002.50 Bid As Specified MSC# 98947187  $213.87 $3,208.05

Unable to supply Bid As Specified MSC#  96315262 $69.82 $1,047.30

Discount

20.0% off Door Hardware on https://www.mscdirect.com

Discount
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