
QUOTE 20170010
DRILL BITS
TABSHEET  

Item CCSD# Description Est. Qty. Unit As Specified, if not, 
specify mfg. & part # Unit Price Ext. Price As Specified, if not, specify mfg. & 

part # Unit Price Ext. Price As Specified, if not, specify 
mfg. & part # Unit Price Ext. Price

1 BH-100 Drill Bit, Steel, 1/16” x Jobber 80 Ea Drillco-450T104 0.87$         69.60$              53005-Norseman 0.29$           23.20$              MSC # 84579598-Hertel 1.00$         80.00$              

2 BH-101 Drill Bit, Steel, 3/32” x Jobber 72 Ea Drillco-450T106 0.92$         66.24$              53007-Norseman 0.31$           22.32$              MSC # 84579614-Hertel 1.04$         74.88$              

3 BH-102 Drill Bit, Steel 1/8” x Jobber 300 Ea Drillco-450T108 0.92$         276.00$            53009-Norseman 0.51$           153.00$             MSC # 84579630-Hertel 1.08$         324.00$            

4 BH-104 Drill Bit, Steel 5/32” x Jobber 120 Ea Drillco-450T110 1.23$         147.60$            53011-Norseman 0.64$           76.80$               MSC # 84579655-Hertel 1.14$         136.80$            

5 BH-105 Drill Bit, Steel 9/32” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T118 2.91$         69.84$              53019-Norseman 1.86$           44.64$               MSC # 84579739-Hertel  3.25$         78.00$              

6 BH-106 Drill Bit, Steel 11/32” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T122 4.29$         102.96$            53023-Norseman 3.07$           73.68$                MSC # 84579770-Hertel 4.25$         102.00$            

7 BH-107 Drill Bit, Steel 17/64” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T117 2.57$         61.68$              53018-Norseman 1.72$           41.28$               MSC # 84579721-Hertel 2.39$         57.36$              

8 BH-108 Drill Bit, Steel 21/64” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T121 3.71$         89.04$              53022-Norseman 2.74$           65.76$                MSC # 84579762-Hertel 4.00$         96.00$              

9 BH-109 Drill Bit, Steel 3/16” x Jobber 150 Ea Drillco-450T112 1.45$         217.50$            53013-Norseman 0.94$           141.00$             MSC # 84579671-Hertel 1.72$         258.00$            

10 BH-110 Drill Bit, Steel 1/4” x Jobber 150 Ea Drillco-450T116 1.99$         298.50$            53017-Norseman 1.58$           237.00$             MSC # 84579713-Hertel 2.16$         324.00$            

11 BH-111 Drill Bit, Steel 5/16” x Jobber 100 Ea Drillco-450T120 3.33$         333.00$            53021-Norseman 2.49$           249.00$             MSC # 84579754-Hertel 3.50$         350.00$            

Vendor
Terms FASTENAL COMPANY

NET 30
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO.

NET 30
CHEMSMART WHOLESALE

NET 30
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12 BH-112 Drill Bit, Steel 3/8” x Jobber 100 Ea Drillco-450T124 4.61$         461.00$            53025-Norseman 3.87$           387.00$              MSC # 84579796-Hertel 4.57$         457.00$            

13 BH-113 Drill Bit, Steel 7/16” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T128 7.30$         175.20$            53029-Norseman 5.62$           134.88$              MSC # 84579838-Hertel 5.81$         139.44$            

14 BH-114 Drill Bit, Steel 1/2” x Jobber 60 Ea Drillco-450T132 7.18$         430.80$            53033-Norseman 8.08$           484.80$            MSC # 84579887-Hertel  6.21$         372.60$            

15 BH-115 Drill Bit, Steel 5/8” x Jobber  24 Ea Drillco-1000EF140 8.48$         203.52$            0310419-Norseman 16.56$         397.44$              MSC # 43481381-Hertel 15.09$       362.16$            

16 BH-116 Drill Bit, Steel 3/4” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-1000EF148 10.36$       248.64$            0311285-Norseman 22.97$         551.28$            
  MSC # 81431488-Value 

Collection 39.10$       938.40$            

17 BH-117 Drill Bit, Steel 13/64” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T113 1.65$         39.60$              53014-Norseman 1.09$           26.16$                MSC # 84579689-Hertel 1.82$         43.68$              

18 BH-118
Drill Bit, Steel 1/4" x 12” x 
Jobber      12 Ea Drillco-1200A116 4.57$         54.84$              No Bid -$                  

1/4 x 12" 135 D C/TP 
DURAPOINT AIRCRAFT 

EXT DR 20.47$       245.64$            

19 BH-119 Drill Bit, Steel 7/32” x Jobber 60 Ea Drillco-450T114 1.75$         105.00$            53015-Norseman 1.09$           65.40$                MSC # 84579697-Hertel 1.97$         118.20$            

20 BH-120 Drill Bit, Steel 7/64” x Jobber 24 Ea Drillco-450T107 0.88$         21.12$              53008-Norseman 0.42$           10.08$                MSC # 84579622-Hertel 1.03$         24.72$              

21 BH-121
Drill Bit, Steel 3/16" x 12

12 Ea Drillco-1200A112 5.35$         64.20$              No Bid -$                  
135D HSS CHICK LAT 

AIRCRAFT EXT DR 7.27$         87.24$              

22 BH-122 Drill Bit, Steel 1/2” x  12" 12 Ea Drillco-1200A132 29.75$       357.00$            No Bid -$                  
135D C/TPD DURAPOINT 

AIRCRAFT EXT DR 37.66$       451.92$            
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23 BH-124 Drill Bit, Masonry 3/16” x 6" 100 Ea Drillco-160A1126 2.17$         217.00$            0239021-Milwaukee Tool 2.72$           272.00$            
 MSC #57595449- Cle-

Line/GFI 3.17$         317.00$            

24 BH-125 Drill Bit, Masonry 1/4” x 6” 100 Ea Drillco-160A1166 2.17$         217.00$            0239022-Dewalt 2.79$           279.00$            
Tru-Cut - MSC # 71212161- 

Made in  USA 1.40$         140.00$            

25 BH-126 Drill Bit, Masonry 5/16” x 6" 100 Ea Drillco-160A1206 2.82$         282.00$            0239023-Dewalt 2.94$           294.00$            
 MSC # 71212203-Made in 

USA 1.77$         177.00$            

26 BH-127 Drill Bit, Masonry 3/8” x 6” 24 Ea Drillco-160A1246A 2.85$         68.40$              0239024-Dewalt 3.30$           79.20$              
 MSC # 71212252-Made in 

USA 2.49$         59.76$              

27 BH-128 Drill Bit, Masonry 1/2” x 6” 24 Ea Drillco-160A1326A 3.85$         92.40$              0239025-Milwaukee Tool 4.26$           102.24$            
 MSC # 71212344-Made in 

USA 2.14$         51.36$              

28 BH-129 Drill Bit, Masonry 5/8” x 6” 12 Ea Drillco-160A1406B 5.20$         62.40$              0210936-Milwaukee Tool 8.77$           105.24$            
 MSC # 71212401-Made in 

USA 3.94$         47.28$              

29 BH-130 Drill Bit, Masonry 3/4” x 6” 12 Ea Drillco-160A1086B 10.58$       126.96$            0234633-Dewalt 10.66$         127.92$            
 MSC # 71212484-Made in 

USA 7.34$         88.08$              

30 BH-131
Drill Bit, Steel 3/8” x 12”

12 Ea Drillco-1200C124 21.50$       258.00$            No Bid -$                  
135D C/TPD DURAPOINT 

AIRCRAFT EXT DR 26.73$       320.76$            

31 BH-133 Drill Bit, Masonry 3/16” x 12” 24 Ea Drillco-170A11212 8.38$         201.12$            0234861-Milwaukee Tool 11.39$         273.36$             MSC # 06976179-DeWalt 9.32$         223.68$            
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32 BH-134 Drill Bit, Masonry 1/4” x 12” 24 Ea Drillco-160A11612 4.22$         101.28$            0259405-Dewalt 5.21$           125.04$            
 MSC # 71251169-Made in 

USA 3.46$         83.04$              

33 BH-135 Drill Bit, Masonry 5/16” x 12” 12 Ea Drillco-160A12012 5.19$         62.28$              0259406-Dewalt 5.46$           65.52$              
 MSC # 71251201-Made in 

USA 3.81$         45.72$              

34 BH-136 Drill Bit, Masonry 3/8” x 12” 12 Ea Drillco-160A12412A 6.72$         80.64$              0259407-Dewalt 5.30$           63.60$              
 MSC # 71251243-Made in 

USA 4.54$         54.48$              

35 BH-137 Drill Bit, Masonry 1/2” x 12” 12 Ea Drillco-160A13212A 8.89$         106.68$            0259412-Dewalt 6.73$           80.76$              
 MSC # 71251326-Made in 

USA 5.35$         64.20$              

36 BH-138 Drill Bit, Masonry 5/8” x 12” 12 Ea Drillco-160A14012A   0259415-Dewalt 9.03$           108.36$            
 MSC # 71251409-Made in 

USA 8.35$         100.20$            

37 BH-139 Drill Bit, Masonry, 3/4” x 12” 12 Ea Drillco-160A14812B 13.90$       166.80$            0259417-Bosch 12.72$         152.64$            
 MSC # 71251482-Made in 

USA 9.95$         119.40$            
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