Tabsheet COBB County School District
RFQ 2021026, HVAC Supplies
Vendor Name: AARP Inc. dba Johnstone Supply of Atlanta Brock Air Products dba 1 HVAC Ed's Supply Company
Terms: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
CCSD # Item GROUP 1- CAPACITORS & RELAYS (E::y UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price
ACO77 1 |Capacitor, Round 5SMFD 440 Volt 20 Ea Amrad USA2204( Only) Amrad USA2204 S 4.71 $94.20
ACO78 2 |Capacitor, Round 7.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2206 (Only) Amrad USA2206 S 5.76 $57.60
ACO79 3 [Capacitor, Round 10MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2207 (Only) Amrad USA2207 $ 6.08 $60.80
AC080 4 Capacitor, Round 12.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2208 (Only) Amrad USA2208 S 6.15 $61.50
ACO81 5 [Capacitor, Round 15MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2209 (Only) Amrad USA2209 $ 6.78 $67.80
AC082 6  |Capacitor, Round 20MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2211 (Only) Amrad USA2211 S 7.50 $75.00
ACO83 7  |Capacitor, Round 25MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2212 (Only) Amrad USA2212 $ 9.31 $93.10
AC084 8  |Capacitor, Round 30MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2213 (Only) Amrad USA2213 S 9.83 $98.30
ACO85 9  |Capacitor, Round 35MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2214 (Only) Amrad USA2214 $ 1119 $111.90
ACO086 10 |Capacitor, Round 40MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2215 (Only) Amrad USA2215 $ 1163 $116.30
ACO87 11 |Capacitor, Round 45MFD 440 Volt 20 Ea Amrad USA2216 (Only) Amrad USA2216 $ 1431 $286.20
ACO088 12 [Capacitor, Oval 5SMFD 440 Volt 50 Ea Amrad USA2029 (Only) Amrad USA2029 S 355 $177.50
ACO89 13 [Capacitor, Oval 7.5MFD 440 Volt 50 Ea Amrad USA2031 (Only) Amrad USA2031 S 4.18 $209.00
AC090 14 [Capacitor, Oval 10MFD 440 Volt 40 Ea Amrad USA2035 (Only) Amrad USA2035 S 4.65 $186.00
AC091 15 |Capacitor, Oval 12.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2037 (Only) Amrad USA2037 S 4.86 $48.60
AC092 16 |Capacitor, Oval 15MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Titan TOCF15 $ 195 $19.50[  SMARTELECT SE 1540-OPV $2.75 $27.50 Titan Pro TOCF15 $2.02 $20.20
AC093 17 [Capacitor, Oval 20MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2260 (Only)
AC094 18 [Capacitor, Oval 25MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2040 (Only)
AC095 19 |Capacitor, Oval 30MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Titan TOCF30 s 298 $29.80 TITAN PRO TOCF 30 $3.97 $39.70 Titan Pro TOCF30 $3.09 $30.90
AC096 20 |Capacitor, Oval 35MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Titan TOCF35 S 348 $34.80 TITAN PRO TOCF 35 $4.30 $43.00 Titan Pro TOCF35 $3.60 $36.00
AC097 21 |Capacitor, Oval 40MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Titan TOCF40 $ 379 $37.90 TITAN PRO TOCF 40 $4.75 $47.50 Titan Pro TOCF40 $3.91 $39.10
AC098 22 |Capacitor, Oval 45MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Titan TOCF45 S 384 $38.40 TITAN PRO TOCF 45 $5.05 $50.50
AC099 23 |Capacitor, Dual Round 35/5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2227 (Only) Amrad USA2227 $ 1160 $116.00
AC100 24 |Capacitor, Dual Round 45/5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2236 (Only) Amrad USA2236 $ 1530 $153.00
AC131 25 |Capacitor, Oval 4/MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2028 (Only) Amrad USA2028 S BY/5! $37.50
AC103 26 |(EPR) Hard Start Kits 10 Ea Supco #SPPSE (Only) Supco $21.95 $219.50
AC104 27 |(EPR) Hard Start Kits 10 Ea Supco #SPP8E (Only) Supco SPPSE $ 2183 $218.30 Supco $26.99 $269.90 Supco SPPSE $23.90 $239.00
Est.
CCSD # Item GROUP 2 - THERMOSTAT Qsty UM [ Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Th tat, 7 Day Pi bl Non-Pi bl B 5 5
AC030 1 ermostat, / bay Programmable or Mon-Frogrammable | - g, Ea | White Rodgers |  #1F85U-42PR (Only) White Rodgers 1F85U-42PR s 7332 $4,399.20 W/R $92.25 | $5535.00 | WhiteRoger | 1F85U-42PR | $67.93 | $4,075.80
Universal Multi-Stage Heat Pump or A/C
Est.
CCSD # Item GROUP 3 — REFRIGERANTS Qsty UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price
Refrigerant, R 410A, 25 LB Disposable Drum
AC073 1 20 Ea Forane R410A-25 $ 193.00 $3,860.00 IGAS R410A $140.00 $2,800.00 Mastercool r410a-25lb $69.86 $1,397.20
Refrigerant, R 427A, 25 LB Disposable Drum
AC129 2 50 Ea Forane R427A-25 $ 370.00 $18,500.00 ASPEN R427A $298.90 $14,945.00
Est.
CCSD # Item GROUP 4 - CHEMICALS Qsty UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Coil cleaner, green, concentrate, Non-acid biodegradable,
AC055 1 1 gallon container 100 Gal ACE ccL1 S 12.04 $1,204.00| Atlantic Chemical CCL-1 $11.99 $1,199.00 ACE CCL-1 $10.75 $1,075.00
ACO55A , |Coil cleaner, blue, concentrate, Non-acid foaming 150 | Gal Nu-Brite #4291-08 or Equal Nu Calgon 4291-08 $ 1856 $2,784.00| Atlantic Chemical ABP-1 $18.75 $2,812.50 ACE ABP-1 $14.81 | $2,221.50
biodegradable 1 gallon container
Ice Machine Cleaner and Sanitizer In One Product, 1 gallon
AC058 3 |container 60 Gal | IDBrand (Only) ID Soluitions R160801 $ 2333 $1,399.80
A/CRe-New -4 Oz. bottle - Unpressurized
AC039 4 50 Ea Nu Calgon #4057-55 Nu Calgon 4057-55 $  61.25 $3,062.50 Nu Calgon 4057-55 $59.76 $2,988.00
Acid St Acid trali Nu-Cal
ACO57 5 |AcidScavenger Acid neutralizer (Nu-Calgon) 40 Ea Nu-Calgon #4301-02 (Only) Nu Calgon 4301-02 s 2118 $847.20 Nu-Calgon 4301-02 $20.66 $826.40

Awarded Items Highlighted in Yellow

*Item Did Not Meet Specifications (Bid Metal Not Plastic)

** tem Not Awarded Due to No Quotes for Approved Only Item
***Resolving Tie Bids - See Purchasing Regulation - Section VIII, #28

Page 1of 4




Tabsheet COBB County School District
RFQ 2021026, HVAC Supplies
Vendor Name: AARP Inc. dba Johnstone Supply of Atlanta Brock Air Products dba 1 HVAC Ed's Supply Company
Terms: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
CCSD # Item GROUP 5 - SUPPLIES (E::' UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price
Y
Tape, Duct 3”x 60 yds roll, silver, Industrial grade, non-
AC001 1 |metalized, Polyethylene film cloth back 100 RI Shurtape PC8 $10.95 $1,095.00
AC002 [Tape, Insulation. Closed cell foam, 1/8" x 2" x 30 60 RI Nu Calgon 4219-12 s 7.99 $479.40|  Diversitech 6-718 $7.40 $440.00 Diversitech 6-9718. $4.57 $274.20
AC005 3 |Butyl mastic tape, 3" W x 100" Roll 36 RI Hardcast AFG-1402-3 $ 2504 $901.44 HARDCAST 1402 $32.00 | $1,152.00 Hardcast 304100 $25.38 $913.68
Transformer, control secondary, 24v, 75va, mounting: foot
AC006A 4 [|Plate, primary: multi tap 120/208/240v/460, 50/60 hz, 9 50 Ea Totaline #P201-4701 or Equal Packard PF52475 $  20.96 $1,048.00 Packard PF 52475 $30.99 $1,549.50
leads, built in circuit breaker,
AC007 5 Tape, Duct, silver foil, 3” x 50’ Roll 50 RI Shurtape AF-975 $ 9.72 $486.00 Shurtape Foil 3 $11.49 $689.40 Shurtape AF975-3 $9.15 $457.50
One Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp,24
AC069 6 |volt coil with straight through wiring 20 Ea Eaton #C25CNB130T (Only) Eaton C25CNB130T $ 829 $165.80
Two Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp, 24
AC070 7 - . L 30 Ea Eaton #C25CNB230T (Only)
volt coil with straight through wiring
ACO71 g |Three Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp, | 5, Ea Eaton #C25DND330T (Only) Eaton C25DND330T $ 2289 $686.70
24 volt coil universal mounting plate
i iqui 4 Joh Johnson
ACO17 g [|Switch liquid flow type, 17 NPT 10 Ea CZH";ZI"S #F61KB-11C or Equal | Johnson Controls F261KAH-VO1C s 11473  $1,147.30 same F261KAH-VOLC $144.00 | $1,440.00 P, F261KAH $123.07 | $1,230.70
Low Temp. Leak Reactant, Plastic Spray bottle Big/BLU . . . . q 5
AC040 10 24 | ga | Refrigeration #RT1505 (Only) R RT1505 S 9.06 $217.44 o RT150s $8.58 $205.92
Technologies Technologies Technologies
Leak detector, gas 8 oz. Plastic bottle with dauber, . X
AC042 11 fluorescent color, 30/200 degree F 30 Ea Nu Calgon 4184-53 S 4.93 $147.90| Atlantic Chemical LD-8 $5.85 $175.50 ACE LD-8 $4.26 $127.80
Brazing rod, 1/8”, 80 % copper, 15% silver, 5 % phosphorus Lucas Mihaupt
AC045 12 (Not Square Rods) 40 Ea Lucas-Milhaupt 95150 S 24238 $9,695.20] (Only sold in tubes of 95150 $3.86 $216.16 Lucas-mihaupt 95150 $3.87 $154.80
28 flat rods)
ACO46 13 Z'Oungz"' 5"EVE' tl”az'"g’ 6.5 0z bottle with brush, Harris 10 Btl Harris #40022 or Equal Lucas-Milhaupt 75014 $ 533 $53.30 Handy Flux 97030 $4.39 $43.90
or Equa
AC004 14 |Bullet Piercing Valve, 1/4",5/16, 3/8" 12 Ea Supco #BPV31 (Only) Supco BPV31 S 2.55 $30.60 $3.25 $39.00 Supco Bpv31 $4.20 $50.40
AC011 15 | Condenser Fin Whisk Brush, 3" x 2 1/8" 20 Ea Schaefer #02026 (Only) Schaefer #02026 S 1.24 $24.80
Plastic Thermostat Guard Kits, Rectangular, Opaque with X X
AC020 16 . . 50 Ea Robertshaw #190-069 Honeywell TG512A1009 S 22.26 $1,113.00 Discontinued
Solid and Ring Base
**Hi-Temp Multi-purpose Grease, 14 oz. Cartridge,
Cheml.cally and mechanlt.:ally stable, water reflstant., highly ! Red-N-Tacky #2
AC072 17 |adhesive and have superior storage life. Service rating 0 60 Tube Lucas Oil
Item #10005 (Only)
deg. F to 500 deg. F
AC032 18 [Liquid Line Filter Dryer 3/8" Sweat 5.3" L X 2.69" DIA. 12 Cans Parker #0835 (Only) Parker-Sporlan 083 $ 1419 $170.28
AC033 19 |Hauid Line Filter Dryer 3/8" Sweat 5.96" L X 3.03" DIA. 12 | cans Parker #C1635 (Only) Parker-Sporlan 1635 $  18.20 $218.40
ACO74 20 |Spray Penetrating Oil, 10 oz. Can, 60 | cans CLENAIR #61105 or Equal CLENAIR AK12 $ 1197 $718.20 Kano Labs AeroKroil 18.45 $1,107.60 | ***Nu Calgon 61105 $10.95 $657.00
AC062 21 | Three Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25,40amp, | 54 Ea Eaton #C25DNF340T (Only) Eaton C25DNF340T $ 2584 $775.20
24 volt coil universal mounting plate
Transformer, control secondary, 24v, 50va, mounting: foot
AC063 22 |Plate or 1/2 hub. primary: multi tap 50 Ea RIB #TRS0VA015 (Only) RIB TR50VA015 $ 1823 $911.50 Same $29.75 $1,487.50
120/208/240v/277/460, 50/60 hz, built in circuit breaker.
CCSD # Item GROUP 6 - FILTERS (E::' UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price
Y
AC123 1 |WaterFilter, Everpure 24 Ea Everpure #7CBS (Only) Nu Calgon 9618-16(7CB5) $ 7523 $1,805.52 $74.90 $1,797.60 Everpure 7CB5 $64.34 $1,544.16
Water Filter, Nu-Calgon 4781-12 is
I it
AC124 2 20 | Ea Nu-Calgon #4622-10 (Only) Nu Calgon 9781-12 $ 5796 |  $1,159.20 Nu-Calgon r(efsazze::)ei: $5651 | $1,130.20
obsolete)
Water Filter, Ice-O-Matic
AC122 3 20 Ea Ice-O-Matic #10MQ 300-05827 (Only) Ice-O-Matic lomMmQ $ 100.96 $2,019.20 Ice-O-Matic 300-05827 $100.46 $2,009.20
OTHER RELATED ITEMS
% Discount off list or % Mark-up over cost offered for other items of similar scope as described in Section 5.8. Additional parts have to be quoted on an item by item process...too .
many ways to call a price as you describe. ¢ 2
Please indicate required lead time upon receipt of order 5-15 days 35 Days

Awarded Items Highlighted in Yellow

*Item Did Not Meet Specifications (Bid Metal Not Plastic)

** tem Not Awarded Due to No Quotes for Approved Only Item
***Resolving Tie Bids - See Purchasing Regulation - Section VIII, #28
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Tabsheet COBB County School District
RFQ 2021026, HVAC Supplies
Vendor Name: Ferguson Enterprises Hudson Technolgies Ct y dba Aspen Refri Mingledorff's Trane Supply
Terms: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
CCSD # Item GROUP 1- CAPACITORS & RELAYS Zs; UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
ACO77 1 |Capacitor, Round 5SMFD 440 Volt 20 Ea Amrad USA2204( Only) MARS 2443207 $1.11 $22.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2204 $4.97 $99.40 $4.89 $97.80
ACO78 2 |Capacitor, Round 7.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2206 (Only) MARS 2444043 $1.32 $13.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2206 $5.64 $56.40 $5.83 $58.30
ACO79 3 |Capacitor, Round 10MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2207 (Only) MARS 2444033 $1.65 $16.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2207 $5.95 $59.50 $6.05 $60.50
AC080 4 Capacitor, Round 12.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2208 (Only) MARS 3687081 $1.92 $19.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2208 $6.12 $61.20 $6.24 $62.40
ACO81 5 |Capacitor, Round 15MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2209 (Only) MARS 2444034 $1.96 $19.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2209 $6.64 $66.40 $6.65 $66.50
AC082 6 |Capacitor, Round 20MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2211 (Only) MARS 3927642 $2.37 $23.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2211 $7.85 $78.50 $8.13 $81.30
ACO83 7 |Capacitor, Round 25MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2212 (Only) MARS 2972346 $2.66 $26.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2212 $9.72 $97.20 $9.30 $93.00
AC084 8 |capacitor, Round 30MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2213 (Only) MARS 2444036 $3.34 $33.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2213 $11.09 $110.90 $10.60 $106.00
ACO85 9 |capacitor, Round 35MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2214 (Only) MARS 2443254 $3.41 $34.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2214 $12.31 $123.10 $13.32 $132.20
ACOS6 10 |Capacitor, Round 40MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2215 (Only) MARS 2443244 $3.51 $35.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2215 $12.80 $128.00 $12.75 $127.50
ACO87 11 |Capacitor, Round 45MFD 440 Volt 20 Ea Amrad USA2216 (Only) MARS 2443246 $4.26 $85.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2216 $13.27 $265.40 $13.34 $266.80
AC088 12 |Capacitor, Oval SMFD 440 Volt 50 Ea Amrad USA2029 (Only) MARS 1841488 $1.15 $57.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2029 $3.99 $199.50 $3.59 $179.50
ACO89 13 |Capacitor, Oval 7.5MFD 440 Volt 50 Ea Amrad USA2031 (Only) MARS 1841489 $1.33 $66.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2031 $4.65 $232.50 $4.57 $228.50
AC090 14 |Capacitor, Oval 10MFD 440 Volt 40 Ea Amrad USA2035 (Only) MARS 2443229 $1.31 $52.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2035 $5.37 $214.80 $5.09 $203.60
AC091 15 |Capacitor, Oval 12.5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2037 (Only) MARS 2443230 $1.76 $17.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2037 $5.43 $54.30 $5.15 $51.50
AC092 16 |Capacitor, Oval 15MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea MARS 2443231 $1.71 $17.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2034 $6.80 $68.00 SFCAP15440 $3.01 $30.10
AC093 17 |Capacitor, Oval 20MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2260 (Only) MARS 2444025 $2.09 $20.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2260 $8.89 $88.90 $11.50 $115.00
AC094 18 |Capacitor, Oval 25MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2040 (Only) MARS 2443233 $2.55 $25.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2040 $9.33 $93.30 $12.50 $125.00
AC095 19  |Capacitor, Oval 30MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea MARS 2443235 $2.76 $27.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2213 $12.31 $123.10 SFCAP30440 $4.04 $40.40
AC096 20 |Capacitor, Oval 35MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea MARS 2821361 $3.01 $30.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2214 $12.31 $123.10 SFCAP35440 $4.45 $44.50
AC097 21 |Capacitor, Oval 40MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea MARS 2060335 $3.20 $31.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2215 $12.80 $128.00 SFCAP40440 $4.63 $46.30
AC098 22 |Capacitor, Oval 45MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea MARS 2060337 $3.47 $34.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2216 $13.27 $132.70 SFCAP45440 $4.89 $48.90
AC099 23 |Capacitor, Dual Round 35/5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2227 (Only) MARS 2443221 $4.34 $43.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2227 $12.27 $122.70 $12.92 $129.20
AC100 24 |Capacitor, Dual Round 45/5MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2236 (Only) MARS 2443223 $4.63 $46.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2236 $16.15 $161.50 $15.95 $159.50
AC131 25 | Capacitor, Oval 4/MFD 440 Volt 10 Ea Amrad USA2028 (Only) MARS 2496431 $1.01 $10.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid USA2028 $3.79 $37.90 $3.57 $35.70
AC103 26 |(EPR) Hard Start Kits 10 Ea Supco #SPPSE (Only) SUPCO SP-SSPPSE $17.99 $179.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SUPCO-SPPSE $20.99 $209.90 SPP5! $6.60 $66.00
AC104 27 |(EPR) Hard Start Kits 10 Ea Supco #SPPSE (Only) SUPCO 2240860 $21.54 $215.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SPPSE $26.63 $266.30 SPPSE! $25.27 $252.70
Est.
CCSD # Item GROUP 2 - THERMOSTAT Qsty UM [ Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Th tat, 7 Day Pi bl Non-Pi bl . g g A A
AC030 1 ermostat, 7 Day Programmable or Non-Programmable | g, | g, | \vhite Rodgers |  #1F85U-42PR (Only) | WHITE RODGERS 7044088 $68.74 | $4,124.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1F85U-42PR $0.00 $64.00 | $3,840.00
Universal Multi-Stage Heat Pump or A/C
Est.
CCSD # Item GROUP 3 - REFRIGERANTS Qsty UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Refrigerant, R 410A, 25 LB Disposable Drum )
AC073 1 20 Ea ARKEMA 1875659 $99.00 $1,980.00 Please\:zze:tltached R410A25 $129.95 $2,599.00 pricing fluctuates weekly - no way to provide pricing for year
Refrigerant, R 427A, 25 LB Disposable Drum -
AC129 2 50 Ea ARKEMA 5119319 $199.00 $9,950.00 Please s:;leAstltached R427A25 $223.80 $11,190.00 pricing fluctuates weekly - no way to provide pricing for year
CCSD # Item GROUP 4 - CHEMICALS Zs:' UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Y
Coil cleaner, green, concentrate, Non-acid biodegradable,
AC055 1 1 gallon container 100 Gal NUCALGON 1601720 $16.26 $1,626.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DT-PRO-GREEN $13.40 $1,340.00 CHMO00764 $20.59 $2,059.00
ACO55A , |Coil cleaner, blue, concentrate, Non-acid foaming 150 | Gal Nu-Brite #4291-08 or Equal NUCALGON 1601724 $18.11 | $2,716.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4291-08 $21.27 | $3,190.50 CHMO00393 $18.82 | $2,823.00
biodegradable 1 gallon container
Ice Machine Cleaner and Sanitizer In One Product, 1 gallon
AC058 3 |container 60 Gal | IDBrand (Only) NUCALGON 1727237 $47.85 | $2,871.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4287-08 $56.67 | $3,400.20 no bid no bid
A/CRe-New -4 Oz. bottle - Unpressurized
AC039 4 50 Ea Nu Calgon #4057-55 NUCALGON 4005763 $60.05 $3,002.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4057-55 $69.81 $3,490.50 CHMO00834 $64.13 $3,206.50
Acid St Acid trali Nu-Cal
ACO57 5 |AcidScavenger Acid neutralizer (Nu-Calgon) 40 | Ea Nu-Calgon #4301-02 (Only) NUCALGON 1743732 $2160 | $864.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4301-02 $2425 | $970.00 CHMO00413 $23.43 | $937.20

Awarded Items Highlighted in Yellow

*Item Did Not Meet Specifications (Bid Metal Not Plastic)

** tem Not Awarded Due to No Quotes for Approved Only Item
***Resolving Tie Bids - See Purchasing Regulation - Section VIII, #28
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Tabsheet COBB County School District
RFQ 2021026, HVAC Supplies
Vendor Name: Ferguson Enterprises Hudson Technolgies Ct y dba Aspen Refri Mingledorff's Trane Supply
Terms: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
CCSD # Item GROUP 5 - SUPPLIES Zs:' UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
Y
Tape, Duct 3”x 60 yds roll, silver, Industrial grade, non-
ACO01 1 |metalized, Polyethylene film cloth back 100 RI SHURTAPE 1357205 $8.98 $898.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS-300 $6.64 $664.00 PC600-SILVER $7.13 $713.00
AC002 2 |Tape Insulation. Closed cell foam, 1/8” x 2" x 30 60 | R DIVERSITECH 547715 $4.79 $287.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P904-0101 $7.43 $445.80 FOM00130 $8.18 $490.80
ACO05 3 [Butyl mastic tape, 3" W x 100" Roll 36 RI HARDCAST 794585 $28.98 | $1,043.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS-327-3IN $31.75 | $1,143.00 Hardcast 304100! $28.00 | $1,008.00
Transformer, control secondary, 24v, 75va, mounting: foot
ACO06A 4 [|Plate, primary: multi tap 120/208/240v/460, 50/60 hz, 9 50 Ea Totaline #P201-4701 or Equal MARS 171884 $18.12 $905.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P201-4701 $21.37 | $1,068.50 SFTRR75VA $18.86 $943.00
leads, built in circuit breaker,
AC007 5 |Tape, Duct, silver foil, 3” x 50’ Roll 50 RI SHURTAPE 3879352 $11.07 $553.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS-330 3IN $11.20 $560.00 152000-3! $15.19 $759.50
One Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp,24
AC069 6 |volt coil with straight through wiring 20 Ea Eaton #C25CNB130T (Only) MARS 3927527 $6.47 $129.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid C25CNB130T $145.33 | $2,906.60 Eaton C25CNB130T! $17.43 $348.60
Two Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp, 24 . . . .
ACO70 7 L ) L 30 Ea Eaton #C25CNB230T (Only) MARS 3927746 $7.30 $219.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid C25CNB230T $201.00 | $6,030.00 Eaton C25BNB230T! $22.12 $663.60
volt coil with straight through wiring
ACO71 g |Three Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25, 30 amp, | 5, Ea Eaton #C25DND330T (Only) MARS 3927940 $12.49 $374.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid C25DND330T $218.00 | $6,540.00 Eaton C25DND330T! $93.60 | $2,808.00
24 volt coil universal mounting plate
itch, liqui " Joh JOHNSON ) ) . .
ACO17 g [|Switch liquid flow type, 17 NPT 10 Ea onnson #F61KB-11C or Equal SP-JF261KAHVOIC | $144.63 | $1,446.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid F61KB-11! $116.40 | $1,164.00
Controls CONTROLS
Low Temp. Leak Reactant, Plastic Spray bottle Big/BLU . .
Refrigeration REFRIGERATION . . " "
AC040 10 24 E #RT150 (Onl 3347060 8.68 208.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid RT150S! 9.77 234.48
2 | Technologies (only) TECHNOLOGIES $ $ o8l o8l o8l o8l $ $
Leak detector, gas 8 oz. Plastic bottle with dauber, HERCULES - - . -
AC042 11 |fyorescent color, 30/200 degree F 30 Ea CHEMICAL 38403 $6.82 $204.60 No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi P902-4508 $3.25 $97.50 CHMO00839 $5.45 $163.50
Brazing rod, 1/8”, 80 % copper, 15% silver, 5 % phosphorus
AC045 12 |(Not Square Rods) 40 Ea HARRIS 4514011 $96.51 | $3,860.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15%SILVER-1LB $84.98 | $3,399.20 95150 $62.37 | $2,494.80
AC046 13 Z'Oungz"' 5"EVE' tl”az'"g’ 6.5 0z bottle with brush, Harris 10 Btl Harris #40022 or Equal HARRIS 125255 $8.01 $80.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid OAT-30014 $3.93 $39.30 40022! $3.81 $38.10
or Equa
AC004 14 [Bullet Piercing Valve, 1/4",5/16,3/8" 12 Ea Supco #BPV31 (Only) SUPCO 96290 $2.35 $28.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SUPCO-BPV31 $6.50 $78.00 BPV31! $2.74 $32.88
ACO11 15 |Condenser Fin Whisk Brush, 3" x 2 1/8" 20 Ea Schaefer #02026 (Only) MARS 357137 $1.89 $37.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 02026! $7.28 $145.60
Plastic Thermostat Guard Kits, Rectangular, Opaque with . . . .
AC020 16 |Solid and Ring Base 50 Ea Robertshaw #190-069 DIVERSITECH 447169 $11.89 $594.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid *MARS-70216 $11.81 $590.50 GRD01449 $14.21 $710.50
**Hi-Temp Multi-purpose Grease, 14 oz. Cartridge,
Chemically and mechanically stable, water resistant, highly| Red-N-Tacky #2
AC072 17 |adhesive and have superior storage life. Service rating 0 60 Tube Lucas Oil \tem #10005 (yOnl ) **MARS 1672540 $4.23 $253.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
deg. F to 500 deg. F v
AC032 18 |Liquid Line Filter Dryer 3/8" Sweat 5.3" L X 2.69" DIA. 12 | cans Parker #0835 (Only) 143180 $14.97 $179.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P502-C083S $8.41 $100.92 083s $21.25 $255.00
AC033 19 |Hauid Line Filter Dryer 3/8" Sweat 5.96" L X 3.03" DIA. 12 | cans Parker #C1635 (Only) 335840 $19.19 $230.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P502-C163S $9.81 $117.72 C163s! $28.50 | $342.00
ACO74 20 |Spray Penetrating Oil, 10 oz. Can, 60 | cans CLENAIR #61105 or Equal ***NUCALGON 2488134 $10.95 $657.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AEROKROIL-100Z $16.47 $988.20 CHMO1080 $12.27 $736.20
AC062 21 | Three Pole definite purpose contactor, Type C25,40amp, | 54 Ea Eaton #C25DNF340T (Only) EATON 7945880 $106.60 | $3,198.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid C25DNF340T! $105.00 | $3,150.00
24 volt coil universal mounting plate
Transformer, control secondary, 24v, 50va, mounting: foot
AC063 22 |Plate or 1/2 hub. primary: multi tap 50 Ea RIB #TRS0VA015 (Only) MARS 171883 $19.01 $950.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid TR50VA015 $19.08 $954.00 TRR02013 $22.90 | $1,145.00
120/208/240v/277/460, 50/60 hz, built in circuit breaker.
CCSD # Item GROUP 6 - FILTERS (E::' UM | Approved MFG Approved Model # MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price MFG Model Unit Price | Ext. Price
y
AC123 1 |WaterFilter, Everpure 24 Ea Everpure #7CBS (Only) WATER INC. 3765570 $74.74 $1,793.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid EV961811! $132.00 | $3,168.00
Water Filter, Nu-Calgon
AC124 2 20 Ea Nu-Calgon #4622-10 (Only) NUCALGON 3758243 $50.44 | $1,008.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4622-10 $56.41 | $1,128.20 FLRO6917 $58.87 | $1,412.88
Water Filter, Ice-O-Matic
AC122 3 20 Ea Ice-O-Matic | #I0MQ 300-05827 (Only) EVERPURE 5127182 $126.90 | $2,537.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
OTHER RELATED ITEMS
% Discount off list or % Mark-up over cost offered for other items of similar scope as described in Section 5.8. School system is provided a discount based on tier achieved by
amount of itmes purchased.
Please indicate required lead time upon receipt of order Please note we offer free delivery 1-3 days A.R.O (emergencies
sooner). Please see attached,

Awarded Items Highlighted in Yellow

*Item Did Not Meet Specifications (Bid Metal Not Plastic)

** tem Not Awarded Due to No Quotes for Approved Only Item
***Resolving Tie Bids - See Purchasing Regulation - Section VIII, #28
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