
Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty. List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG 

Name and 

Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

1-30 $435.00 $444.62 $2,980.80

31+ $429.00 $2,715.84

1-30 $546.00 5 years $593.76 $2,143.80

31+ $539.00 $2,072.34

1-30 $265.00
Fisherbrand 

S72596
5 years $202.04 $919.80

31+ $260.00 $838.04

1-30 $85.00 NO BID

31+ $80.00

1-30 $182.00
Fisherbrand 

S72581
5 years $115.91 $1,077.30

31+ $172.00 $981.54

1-30 $805.00
Fisherbrand 

S42669ND
$833.48

31+ $780.00

3
Stereo Microscope, Parco XMT 103 or 

CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item limited lifetime

Leica 

Microsystems
5

Compound Microscope, Parco LTM 

0302 or CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item limited lifetime

Leica 

Microsystems
12 months

Handheld Digital Microscope (Camera), 

National S01-0803 or CCSD Approved  

Equivalent

exact item one year

12 months

Terms 30-60 Days 3-5 ARO (when in stock) within 4-6 weeks ARO

Vendor Capital Microscope Services, Inc. Fisher Scientific Company LLC Leica Microsystems Inc.

MICROSCOPES

1
Digital Microscopy System, National DC-

128 or CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item

limited lifetime 

microscope/one 

year camera

Leica 

Microsystems
12 months

Leica 

Microsystems
12 months2

Digital Stereo Microscope w/Camera, 

National DC4-456H or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent

exact item

limited lifetime 

microscope/one 

year camera

Please see 

attached warranty 

information for all 

items. 

6

Spectrophotometer, Walter WP-

100DPLUS or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent

exact item five years

4
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

Terms 30-60 Days 3-5 ARO (when in stock) within 4-6 weeks ARO

Vendor Capital Microscope Services, Inc. Fisher Scientific Company LLC Leica Microsystems Inc.

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty. List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG 

Name and 

Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

1-30 $85.00 Ohaus S40020 5 years $99.18

31+ $82.00

1-30 $229.00 1 year $239.27

31+ $229.00

1-30 $448.00 2 years $462.30

31+ $448.00

1-30 $113.10 1 year $92.38

31+ $113.10

1-30 $107.20 1 year $89.12

31+ $107.20

one year

10

Compact Scale, 2000g x 1g, VWR WLS 

175800, Ohaus CS2200 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent

Model Change 

CX2200
one year

9
Compact Scale, Ohaus CX621 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent
exact item

BALANCES

7

Mechanical Triple Beam Balance, 

2610g cap x .1g, Walter B200-0 or 

CCSD Equivalent

exact item five years

8
Portable Balance, 300g x .01g, Ohaus 

NV222 or CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item two year

8a
Portable Balance, 300g x .001g, Ohaus 

SPX223 or CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item two year
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

Terms 30-60 Days 3-5 ARO (when in stock) within 4-6 weeks ARO

Vendor Capital Microscope Services, Inc. Fisher Scientific Company LLC Leica Microsystems Inc.

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty. List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG 

Name and 

Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

1-30 $126.74 1 year $105.08

31+ $126.74

Related Items

#

14

NOTES:

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

BALANCES

Description

Percent discount for related items

Discount Discount Discount

Carolina Biological Supply Company Deemed Non-Responsive

11
Compact Scale, 5000g x 2g, Ohaus 

CX5200 or CCSD Approved Equivalent
exact item one year

15%

Up to 32% off from current published list prices for our 

full Fisher Science Education product portfolio. 

(www.fisheredu.com). 

Fisher Science Education 2021 Catalogs are digital: 

https://www.fishersci.com/us/en/education-

products/forms/2021-fisher-science-education-

catalogs.html.  

Discount excludes non-catalog, special order, 

sale/clearance items, items that end with “ND” and 

personal protective equipment.  

No item will be discounted below Fisher Science 

Education’s cost.  All items are subject to a cost plus 

15% safety net. 
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty.

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

3
Stereo Microscope, Parco XMT 103 or 

CCSD Approved Equivalent

5
Compound Microscope, Parco LTM 

0302 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Handheld Digital Microscope (Camera), 

National S01-0803 or CCSD Approved  

Equivalent

Terms

Vendor

MICROSCOPES

1
Digital Microscopy System, National DC-

128 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

2

Digital Stereo Microscope w/Camera, 

National DC4-456H or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent

6

Spectrophotometer, Walter WP-

100DPLUS or CCSD Approved 

Equivalent

4

List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

NO BID $428.40

NO BID $428.40

NO BID $572.09

NO BID $572.09

$275.00 $297.24

$265.00 $297.24

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$200.00 $300.77

$190.00 $300.77

$859.00 $713.39 $982.48

$849.00 $713.39 $916.98

SM101-C  

SWIFT 

OPTICAL SSL # 

1396230

Limited Lifetime

Limited Lifetime

134-CLED  

NATIONAL 

BRAND  SSL# 

563299

Limited Lifetime

Thomas Scientific, LLC

7-14 Days 5-10 ARO 2-5 days ARO for in stock items

Parco Scientific Co School Specialty LLC

DC4-456H  

NATIONAL 

BRAND SSL # 

529349

*

MICROSCOPES

DCX-205-RLED  

National Brand 

SSL# 529298

*

UNITED 

PRODUCTS 

#S1000 SSL 

#529576

Exact item **
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

Terms

Vendor

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty.

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

1-30

31+

10

Compact Scale, 2000g x 1g, VWR WLS 

175800, Ohaus CS2200 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent

9
Compact Scale, Ohaus CX621 or CCSD 

Approved Equivalent

BALANCES

7

Mechanical Triple Beam Balance, 

2610g cap x .1g, Walter B200-0 or 

CCSD Equivalent

8
Portable Balance, 300g x .01g, Ohaus 

NV222 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

8a
Portable Balance, 300g x .001g, Ohaus 

SPX223 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Thomas Scientific, LLC

7-14 Days 5-10 ARO 2-5 days ARO for in stock items

Parco Scientific Co School Specialty LLC

List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

$88.00
$186.88 FOR 

THE BALANCE
$78.57

$85.00

$46.80 FOR THE 

WEIGHT SET OF 

3

$73.33

$333.90 $425.00 $278.25

$315.35 $425.00 $259.70

$702.00 $487.50 $686.18

$663.00 $487.50 $640.44

$156.60 $108.75 $130.50

$147.90 $108.75 $121.80

$151.20 $105.00 $87.75

$142.80 $105.00 $81.90

OHAUS BRAND 

MODEL #CX621 

SSL # 2013803

OHAUS BRAND 

MODEL 

#CX2200 SSL 

#2013806

OHAUS BRAND 

MODEL 

#SPX223 (220G 

X .001G) SSL# 

TBD

1 YEAR

5 YEAR

BALANCES

OHAUS BRAND 

# 760-00 & 

80780108  SSL# 

595479 FOR 

BALANCE AND 

# 595797 FOR 

WEIGHTS

**Exact item

OHAUS BRAND 

MODEL # 

SKX422 SSL # 

1540241

Exact item

1 year 

Manufacturer's 

Warranty

Exact item

2 year 

Manufacturer's 

Warranty

Exact item

1 year 

Manufacturer's 

Warranty

1 YEAR

2 YEAR

2 YEAR

Ohaus CR2200, 

#30428206

1 year 

Manufacturer's 

Warranty
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District

B2207, Microscopes and Balances

Terms

Vendor

# ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Qty.

1-30

31+

Related Items

#

14

NOTES:

Awarded items highlighted in yellow

BALANCES

Description

Percent discount for related items

Carolina Biological Supply Company Deemed Non-Responsive

11
Compact Scale, 5000g x 2g, Ohaus 

CX5200 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Thomas Scientific, LLC

7-14 Days 5-10 ARO 2-5 days ARO for in stock items

Parco Scientific Co School Specialty LLC

List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price List MFG Name 

and Model No.

Warranty Unit Price

$178.20 $123.75 $148.50

$168.30 $123.75 $138.60

1 YEAR

BALANCES

Discount Discount

*1 YEAR LIMITED WARRANTY 

Digital/analog cameras (including built-in cameras on 

digital microscopes) and built-in tablets (DCS Series).

**Walter Products Inc. warrants their microscopes to be 

free from manufacturer defects in material and 

workmanship for 5 years under normal use and service 

from the date of purchase. Electrical warranty is valid for 

90 days, unless otherwise deemed a manufacturer 

defect.  After 90 days authorization will be determined on 

an individual basis.

10-15% off list

36% off List Price Science items.  Categories included 

are SS SCIENCE-FOSS/DELTA, SS SCIENCE-

IS/MATH, SS SCIENCE-SCIENCE CATEGORY and 

SUPPLIES-SCIENCE EDUCATION.  Free Freight prefix 

9/5/6 items.

1 year 

Manufacturer's 

Warranty

Discount

Exact item

OHAUS BRAND 

MODEL 

#CX5200 SSL # 

2013805
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