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RFQ Q2021018, Poster Printer Consumable Supplies
Vendor: A&V Holdings Midco LLC ARC Document Solutions LLC Repro Products Inc.
dba AVI-SPL, LLC dba ARC Imaging Resources Net 30
Terms Net 30 Net 30 2-3 Days
Deljve ime: -7 Business Da Davs ARO
# Description MFR MFGPart# VendorPart# Shelf Life Unit Price  Vendor Part# Shelf Life UnitPrice Vendor Part# Shelf Life Unit Price
Poster Paper

1 |24"x40' Scrim Banner Vinyl Canon| 1290Vv133 CAN1290V133 | SEE NOTES| S 121.94 1290V133 2years | S 154.77 | CAN-1290V133 S 140.70
2 [24"x50' Premium Satin Photo Paper HP CZ987A no bid discontinued discontinued

3 |24"x60' Adhesive Matte Vinyl Canon | 0546V845 CANO0546V845 | SEE NOTES| S 138.81 0546V845 2years | S 178.48 S 162.25
4 |24"x75' Everyday Adhesive Matte Polypropylene HP COF18A no bid COF18A 2 years S 188.78 HEW-COF18A SEENOTES| S 171.62
5 [24"x100' Durable Matte Polypropylene Banner Canon| 0834V777 CANO0834V777 SEE NOTES | S 91.04 0834V777 2 years S 115.56 S 105.05
6 |[24"x100' Everyday Matte Polypropylene HP CHO022A no bid CHO022A 2 years S 219.60 HEW-CH022A SEE NOTES| S 199.64
7 [24"x100' Heavy Matte Coated Paper Canon | 0849V342 CANO0849V342 | SEE NOTES| $ 58.27 0849Vv342 2 years S 75.38 S 65.55
8 [24"x100' Heavyweight Coated Paper HP C6029C no bid €6029C 2 years S 7151 HEW-C6029C SEENOTES| S  59.59
9 |24"x100' High Resolution Coated Bond Paper Canon| 1099V649 CAN1099V649 | SEE NOTES | $ 32.12 1099Vv649 2 years S 40.68 | CAN-1099V649 S 3390
10 |24"x100' Matte Coated Paper (5mil) Canon | 0849v354 CANO0849V354 | SEE NOTES| $ 27.96 0849V354 2 years S 36.17 S 3145
11 |24"x100' Universal Heavyweight Coated Paper HP Q14128B no bid Q14128B 2 years S 44.69 HEW - Q1412B SEE NOTES | S 44.48
12 [24"x100" Universal Instant-Dry Gloss Photo Paper HP Q6574A no bid Q6574A 2 years S 111.23 HEW-Q6574A SEE NOTES| S 108.40
13 |24"x100' Universal Instant-Dry Satin Photo Paper HP Q6579A no bid Q6579A 2 years S 111.23 HEW-Q6579A SEE NOTES | S 92.69
14 |24"x150' Bright White Inkjet Paper HP C1860A no bid C1860A 2 years S  27.55 HEW-C1860A SEENOTES| S  21.87
15 |24"x150' Coated Paper HP C6019B no bid C6019B 2 years S 55,62 HEW-Q1404B SEENOTES| S  50.99
16 [24"x150' Economy Bond Paper Canon | 3853A010AA | CAN3853A01AA | SEE NOTES | S 16.54 3853A010AA 2 years S 20.94 S 17.45
17 |24"x150' Universal Bond Paper Canon| 0834V793 discontinued discontinued

18 [24"x150' Universal Bond Paper HP Q1396A no bid Q1396A 2 years S 22.99 HEW-Q1396A SEE NOTES | S 33.67
19 |24"x150' Universal Coated Paper HP Q14048 no bid Q1404B 2 years S 36.43 HEW-Q1404B SEENOTES| S 29.14
20 [24"x164' Premium Plain Paper - 2 rolls per box Canon | 8154A015AA | CAN8154A015AA | SEE NOTES | S 60.89 8154A015AA 2 years S - S 68.50
21 [36"x75' Everyday Adhesive Gloss Polypropylene HP COF28A no bid COF28A 2 years S 238.87 HEW-COF28A SEE NOTES| S 238.87
22 |36"x75' Everyday Adhesive Matte Polypropylene HP COF19A no bid COF19A 2 years S 283.72 HEW-COF19A SEE NOTES| S 257.93
23 [36"x75' Premium Satin Photo Paper HP Q8808A no bid discontinued

24 |36"x100' Everyday Matte Polypropylene HP CHO23A no bid CHO023A 2 years S 229.70 HEW-CH023A SEE NOTES| S 208.82
25 [36"x100' Heavywight Coated Paper HP C6030C no bid C6030C 2 years S 98.52 HEW-C6030C SEENOTES| S 79.71
26 [36"x100' High Resolution Coated Bond Paper Canon| 1099V650 CAN1099V650 | SEE NOTES| S 45.15 1099V650 2 years S - CAN-1099V650 S 47.65
27 |36"x100' Matte Coated Paper (5mil) Canon | 0849V355 CANO0849V355 | SEE NOTES| S 38.93 0849V355 2years | S - CAN-0849V355 S 43.80
28 [36"x100' Universal Heavyweight Coated Paper HP Q14138 no bid Q14138 2 years S 66.20 HEW-Q1413B SEE NOTES | S 58.26
29 [36"x100' Universal Instant-Dry Gloss Photo Paper HP Q6575A no bid Q6575A 2 years S 159.88 HEW-Q6575A SEE NOTES| S 139.03
30 [36"x100' Universal Instant-Dry Satin Photo Paper HP Q6580A no bid Q6580A 2 years S 166.84 HEW-Q6580A SEE NOTES| S 139.03
31 |36"x150' Bright White Inkjet Paper HP C1861A no bid C1861A 2 years S 4214 HEW-C1861A SEENOTES| S 32.79
32 [36"x150' Coated Paper HP C6020B no bid C6020B 2 years S 77.86 HEW-Q1405B SEE NOTES | S 71.37
33 [36"x150' Economy Bond Paper Canon | 3853A011AA | CAN3853A011AA | SEE NOTES | $ 24.78 | 3853A011AA 2years | S 166.84 S 26.15
34 [36"x150' Universal Bond Paper Canon| 0834V794 discontinued discontinued CAN-0834V794 | SEE NOTES| S 34.51
35 [36"x150' Universal Bond Paper HP Q1397A no bid Q1397A 2 years S 33.60 HEW-Q1397A SEENOTES| S  23.96
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RFQ Q2021018, Poster Printer Consumable Supplies

Vendor: AVI-SPL, LLC ARC Imaging Resources Repro Products
Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Time: ARO 5-7 Business ARO 7 Days ARO 2-3 Days
# Description MFR MFG Part# VendorPart# Shelflife UnitPrice Vendor Part# Shelf Life UnitPrice Vendor Part# Shelf Life Unit Price
Poster Paper (Continued)
36 |36"x150' Universal Coated Paper HP Q1405B no bid Q1405B 2 years S 5461 HEW-Q1405B SEENOTES| S  63.00
37 |136"x164' Premium Plain Paper - 2 rolls per box Canon | 8154A014AA | CAN8154A014AA | SEE NOTES | S 91.33 8154A014AA 2 years S 123.30 S 102.75
Ink/Toner
38 |Black Dye, 130ml, PFI-102BK Canon| 0895B001 CAN0895B001 SEE NOTES | S 62.36 0895B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-0895B001AA S 73.00
39 [Cyan Dye, 130ml, PFI-102C Canon| 0896B001 CAN0896B001 SEE NOTES | S 62.36 0896B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-0896B0O01AA S 73.00
40 |Magenta Dye, 130ml, PFI-102M Canon| 0897B001 CAN0897B001 SEE NOTES | S 62.36 0897B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-0897B001AA S 73.00
41 |Magenta Dye, 130ml, PFI-104M Canon 3631B001 CAN3631B001 SEE NOTES | S 62.36 3631B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-3631B0O01AA S 73.00
42 |Matte Black Pigment, 130ml, PFI-102MBK Canon| 0894B001 CANO0894B001 SEE NOTES | $ 62.36 0894B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-0894B001AA S 73.00
43 |Yellow Dye, 130ml, PFI-102Y Canon| 0898B001 CAN0898B001 SEE NOTES | S 62.36 0898B001 2 years S 80.30 | CAN-0894B0O01AA S 73.00
44 |Black Dye, 130ml, PFI-107BK Canon 6705B001 CAN6705B001 SEE NOTES | $ 63.12 6705B001 2 years S 81.40 | CAN-6705B001AA S 74.00
45 |Cyan Dye, 130ml, PFI-107C Canon 6706B001 CAN6706B001 SEE NOTES | S 63.12 6706B001 2 years S 81.40 | CAN-6706B0O01AA S 74.00
46 |Magenta Dye, 130ml, PFI-107M Canon 6707B001 CAN6707B001 SEE NOTES | $ 63.12 6707B001 2 years S 81.40 | CAN-6707B001AA S 74.00
47 |Matte Black Pigment, 130ml, PFI-107MBK Canon 6704B001 CAN6704B001 SEE NOTES | S 63.12 6704B001 2 years S 81.40 | CAN-6704B001AA S 74.00
48 |Yellow Dye, 130ml, PFI-107Y Canon 6708B001 CAN6708B001 SEE NOTES | $ 63.12 6708B001 2 years S 81.40 | CAN-6708B001AA S 74.00
49 |Matte Black Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306 MBK Canon 6656B001 CAN6656B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6656B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6656B001AA S 179.00
50 [Black Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306BK Canon 6657B001 CAN6657B001 SEENOTES | S 151.63 6657B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6657B001AA S 179.00
51 |Cyan Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306C Canon 6658B001 CAN6658B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6658B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6658B001AA S 179.00
52 |Magenta Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306M Canon 6659B001 CAN6659B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6659B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6659B001AA S 179.00
53 |Yellow Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306Y Canon 6660B001 CAN6660B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6660B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6660B0O01AA S 179.00
54 [Photo Cyan Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306PC Canon 6661B001 CAN6661B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6661B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6661B001AA S 179.00
55 |Photo Magenta Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306PM Canon 6662B001 CAN6662B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6662B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6662B001AA S 179.00
56 |Red Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306R Canon 6663B001 CAN6663B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6663B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6663B001AA S 179.00
57 |Green Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306G Canon 6664B001 CAN6664B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6664B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6664B001AA S 179.00
58 [Blue Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306B Canon 6665B001 CAN6665B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6665B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6665B001AA S 179.00
59 |Grey Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306GY Canon 6666B001 CAN6666B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6666B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6666B001AA S 179.00
60 |[Photo Grey Pigment, 330ml, PFI-306PGY Canon 6667B001 CAN6667B001 SEE NOTES | S 151.63 6667B001 2 years S 187.95 | CAN-6667B001AA S 179.00
61 |Matte Black Pigment, 330ml, PFI-302MBK Canon 2215B001 CAN2215B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 2215B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-2215B001AA S 179.00
62 |Black Pigment, 330ml, PFI-302BK Canon 2216B001 CAN2216B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 2216B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-2216B001AA S 179.00
63 |Cyan Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301C Canon 1487B001 CAN1487B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1487B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1487B001AA S 179.00
64 |Magenta Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301M Canon 1488B001 CAN1488B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1488B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1488B001AA S 179.00
65 |Yellow Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301Y Canon 1489B001 CAN1489B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1489B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1489B001AA S 179.00
66 |Photo Cyan Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301PC Canon 14950B001 CAN1490B001 SEENOTES | $ 166.88 1490B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1490B001AA S 179.00
67 |Photo Magenta Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301PM Canon 1491B001 CAN1491B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1491B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1491B001AA S 179.00
68 |Red Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301R Canon 1492B001 CAN1492B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1492B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1492B001AA S 179.00
69 [Green Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301G Canon| 1493B001 CAN1493B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 1493B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1493B001AA S 179.00
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Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Time: ARO 5-7 Business ARO 7 Days ARO 2-3 Days
# Description MFR MFG Part# VendorPart# Shelflife UnitPrice Vendor Part# Shelf Life UnitPrice Vendor Part# Shelf Life Unit Price
Ink/Toner (Continued)
70 [Blue Pigment, 330ml, PFI-301B Canon 1494B001 CAN1494B001 SEE NOTES | $ 166.88 1494B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-1494B001AA S 179.00
71 |Grey Pigment, 330ml, PFI-302GY Canon 2217B001 CAN2217B001 SEE NOTES | S 166.88 2217B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-2217B001AA S 179.00
72 |Photo Grey Pigment, 330ml, PFI-302PGY Canon 2218B001 CAN2218B001 SEE NOTES | $ 166.88 2218B001 2 years S 206.85 | CAN-2218B001AA S 179.00
73 |Black, 80ml, HP-711 HP CZ133A no bid CZ133A 2 years S 74.21 HEW-CZ133A SEE NOTES | $ 70.68
74 |Black, 38ml, HP-711 HP CZ129A no bid CZ129A 2 years S 45.78 HEW-CZ129A SEE NOTES | S 43.60
75 [Cyan, 29ml, HP-711 HP CZ130A no bid CZ130A 2 years S 38.09 HEW-CZ130A SEE NOTES | S 36.28
76 |Magenta, 29ml, HP-711 HP CZ131A no bid CZ131A 2 years S 38.09 HEW-CZ131A SEE NOTES | S 36.28
77 |Yellow, 29ml, HP-711 HP CZ132A no bid CZ132A 2 years S 38.09 HEW-CZ132A SEE NOTES | S 36.28
78 |Yellow, 40ml, HP-728 HP FOJ61A no bid FOJ61A 2 years S 49.88 HEW-F9J61A SEE NOTES | S 43.18
79 [Magenta, 40ml, HP-728 HP FOJ62A no bid FOJ62A 2 years S 49.88 HEW-F9J62A SEE NOTES | S 43.18
80 [Cyan, 40ml, HP-728 HP FOJ63A no bid FOJ63A 2 years S 49.88 HEW-F9J63A SEE NOTES | S 43.18
81 |Matte Black, 69ml, HP-728 HP FOJ64A no bid FOJ64A 2 years S 80.87 HEW-F9J64A SEE NOTES | S 70.02
82 |Yellow, 130ml, HP-728 HP FOJ65A no bid F9J65A 2 years S 121.58 HEW-F9J65A SEENOTES| § 110.28
83 [Magenta, 130ml, HP-728 HP FOJ66A no bid FOJ66A 2 years S 121.58 HEW-F9J66A SEENOTES| $ 110.28
84 |Cyan, 130ml, HP-728 HP FOJ67A no bid FOJ67A 2 years S 121.58 HEW-F9J67A SEENOTES| § 110.28
85 |Matte Black, 300ml, HP-728 HP FOJ68A no bid FOJ68A 2 years S 233.34 HEW-F9J68A SEE NOTES| S 211.65
86 |Yellow, 300ml, HP-728 HP FOK15A no bid FOK15A 2 years S 233.34 HEW-FOK15A SEE NOTES| $ 211.65
87 |Magenta, 300ml, HP-728 HP FOK16A no bid FOK16A 2 years S 233.34 HEW-FOK16A SEE NOTES| $ 211.65
88 |Cyan, 300ml, HP-728 HP FOK17A no bid FOK17A 2 years S 233.34 HEW-FOK17A SEE NOTES| $§ 211.65
Other Consumable Supplies
89 |[Cutter Blade (CT-06) Canon 1482B002 CAN1482B002 FOREVER | $ 74.01 1482B002 2 years S 90.30 | CAN-1482B002AA S 86.00
90 [Maintenance Cartridge (MC-10) Canon 1320B014 CAN1320B014 SEE NOTES | S 54.28 1320B014 2 years S 72.45 | CAN-1320B014AA S 69.00
91 [Maintenance Cartridge (MC-16) Canon 1320B003 CAN1320B003 SEE NOTES | $ 54.28 1320B003 2 years S 72.45 | CAN-1320B003AA S 69.00
92 [Maintenance Cartridge (MC-08) Canon 1320B006 CAN1320B006 SEE NOTES | $ 82.76 1320B006 2 years S 99.75 | CAN-1320B006AA S 95.00
93 [Paper Roll Holder (RH2-26) Canon| 1465B014 CAN1465B014 FOREVER | $ 129.35 1465B014 2 years S 161.00
94 |Paper Roll Holder (RH2-33) Canon 1465B013 CAN1465B013 FOREVER | S 138.59 1465B013 2 years S 172.50 | CAN-1465B013BA S 150.00
95 |Paper Roll Holder (RH2-42) Canon 0362B001 CANO0362B001 FOREVER | $ 138.59 0362B001 2 years S 184.00 | CAN-0362B001AA S 160.00
96 |Paper Roll Holder (RH2-44) Canon 1465B012 CAN1465B012 FOREVER | S 135.87 1465B012 2 years S 184.00 | CAN-1465B012AA S 160.00
97 |Print Head (PF-03) Canon 2251B003 CAN2251B003 SEE NOTES | $ 400.47 2251B003 2 years S 450.00 | CAN-2251B003AA S 450.00
98 |Print Head (PF-04) Canon 3630B003 CAN3630B003 SEE NOTES | S 400.47 3630B003 2 years S 450.00 | CAN-3630B003AA S 450.00
99 [Print Head (PF-05) Canon 3872B003 CAN3872B003 SEE NOTES | $ 400.47 3872B003 2 years S 450.00 | CAN-3872B003AA S  450.00
100 |Printhead Replacement Kit, HP 729 Designjet HP F9J81A no bid F9J81A 2 years S 510.52 HEW-F9J81A SEE NOTES| $ 510.52
101 |Printhead Replacement Kit, HP 711 Designjet HP C1Q10A no bid C1Q10A 2 years S 233.34 HEW-C1Q10A SEE NOTES| $§ 259.11
102 |Spindle - HP Designjet T520 24" HP B3Q36A no bid B3Q36A 2 years S 97.75 S 85.00
103 [Spindle - HP Designjet 36" HP B3Q37A no bid B3Q37A 2 years S 97.75 HEW-B3Q37A SEE NOTES | S 85.00
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Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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Other Consumable Supplies (Continued)
104 |Adapter - HP USB 3.0 to Gigabit HP N7P47AA no bid N7P47AA 2 years S 37.70 S 29.00
105 |Case - HP Designjet Rugged Case HP N9MO7A no bid no bid no bid no bid
Discounts
Description Discount/Rate Discount/Rate Discount/Rate
106 |Discount for additional consumable supplies not listed. 5% OFF MSRP 2% 10%
NOTES: FOR INK/ Maintenance/Printhead SHELF LIFE - A Shelf life is the same as expiration date
manufacture date is printed on each ink. That located on the outside of HP and Canon ink
date could extend much longer but cannot give a cartridges.

blanket date
**Media shelf life is good for years as long as its
kept in a cool/dry place

Awarded items highlighted in yellow



